City of Lynchburg
Bid Tabulation Form

CITY BID NO : 2016-040

PROJECT NAME:Chemicals for WTP/WWTP

BID OPENING DATE:12/21/2015

UNSEALED BID:

BUYER: Lisa Moss SEALED BID: X
TABULATOR: Lisa Moss
VENDOR/CONTRACTOR Coastal Water Technology PVS Chemical Solutions, inc Univar USA, Inc. Southern lonics, Inc.
TERMS/DELIVERY Yes Yes Yes Yes
ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT Yes Yes No Yes
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDE UNIT EXTENDE UNIT EXTENDE
ITEM # QTY DESCRIPTION FREIGHT] PRICE (Unit FREIGHT| D PRICE FREIGHT| D PRICE FREIGHT] D PRICE
PRICE X PRICE . R PRICE . R PRICE . R
Price and (Unit Price (Unit Price (Unit Price
$1.00 $8,000.00 DEFOAMER $0.63 | $451.92 $5,491.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
$2.00 $300,000.00 BTSUDIFFJI'?E No Bid | No Bid No Bid $0.1085 | Included | $32,550.00 | $0.126 - $37,800.00 | $0.085 | $0.0185 | $31,050.00
TOTAL BASE BID $5,491.92 $32,550.00 $37,800.00 $31,050.00
COMMENTS

AWARD TO:

LOWEST BIDDER? Yes

***|F NO, JUSTIFICATION IS:

PREPARED BY: Lisa Moss

Date: 12/22/2015

APPROVED BY: Date:




