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City of Lynchburg 
Procurement Division 
900 Church Street 
Lynchburg, Virginia  24504 
Telephone No.: (434) 455-3970 
Fax No.: (434) 845-0711                     
                                                    Addendum for Invitation for Bids 

Utility Risers, Sewer Tops, Valves and Accessories 
 

14-920 
Date: 06/11/2014 
From: Lisa Moss, Buyer VCA 
RE: Addendum No.  1 
 
This Addendum supplements and amends the original Plans and Specifications and shall be taken into 
account in preparing proposals and shall become a part of the Contract Documents. The Bidder shall indicate 
receipt of this Addendum and all previously issued Addenda on the Bid Form.   
 

1. A REVISED BID SHEET IS ATTACHED.  
2. The bid tabulation for the current contract is attached below.   

 
 

Company Name:    Address:    Date:   

Authorized Signature:      Title:      

Print Name:     Telephone No.:    

Fax No.:   
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ADDENDUM #1 
REVISED BID PRICING SHEET 

 
LOT 1: 
SECTION A1 : MAN HOLE RISERS- SOLID FABRICATED  STEEL MANHOLE RISER 

 
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED 

YEARLY 
QUANTITY 

INDIVIDUAL 
COST 

ESTIMATED 
YEARLY AMOUNT 

% DISCOUNT 
QTY  5 

% DISCOUNT 
QTY 15 

% DISCOUNT 
QTY  25 

23.5 X 1.5 INCH 
RISE 

150 
$ $ $ $ $ 

23.5 X 2 INCH 
RISE 

75 
$ $ $ $ $ 

23 5/8 X 1.5 INCH 
RISE 

60 
$ $ $ $ $ 

23 5/8 X 2 INCH 
RISE 

60 
$ $ $ $ $ 

23 ¼ X 1.5 INCH 
RISE 

150 
$ $ $ $ $ 

23 ¼ X 2 INCH 
RISE 

75 
$ $ $ $ $ 

26 X 1.5 INCH 
RISE 

160 
$ $ $ $ $ 

26 X 1 INCH RISE 75 $ $ $ $ $ 
26 X 2 INCH RISE 60 $ $ $ $ $ 

Total Section A1 N/A N/A $ N/A N/A N/A 
 

 
LOT #1 
SECTION A2 : MAN HOLE RISERS—STEEL EXPANDABLE MANHOLE RISER 

DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED 
YEARLY 

QUANTITY 

INDIVIDUAL 
COST 

ESTIMATED 
YEARLY AMOUNT 

% DISCOUNT 
QTY  5 

% DISCOUNT 
QTY 15 

% DISCOUNT 
QTY  25 

23.5 X 1.5 INCH 
RISE 

150 
$ $ $ $ $ 

23.5 X 2 INCH RISE 75 $ $ $ $ $ 
23 5/8 X 1.5 INCH 
RISE 

60 
$ $ $ $ $ 

23 5/8 X 2 INCH 
RISE 

60 
$ $ $ $ $ 

23 ¼ X 1.5 INCH 
RISE 

150 
$ $ $ $ $ 

23 ¼ X 2 INCH RISE 75 $ $ $ $ $ 
26 X 1.5 INCH RISE 160 $ $ $ $ $ 
26 X 1 INCH RISE 75 $ $ $ $ $ 
26 X 2 INCH RISE 60 $ $ $ $ $ 

Total Section A2 N/A N/A $ N/A N/A N/A 

TOTAL OF 
SECTION A  

( A1 & A2) 
N/A N/A $ N/A N/A N/A 

SECTION B: LAMP STACK RISERS (Diameter: 10.50” Lid thickness: 1.00” Rise: 1.50”) 
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED 

YEARLY 
QUANTITY 

INDIVIDUAL 
COST 

ESTIMATED 
YEARLY AMOUNT 

% DISCOUNT 
QTY 5 

% DISCOUNT 
QTY 15 

% DISCOUNT 
QTY 25 

10.5 X 1 INCH RISE 50 $ $ $ $ $ 
10.5 X 1.5 INCH 
RISE 

60 
$ $ $ $ $ 
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10.5 X 2 INCH RISE 50 $ $ $ $ $ 
12 X 1 INCH RISE 50 $ $ $ $ $ 
12 X 1.5 INCH RISE 50 $ $ $ $ $ 
12 X 2 INCH RISE 50 $ $ $ $ $ 

Total Section B N/A N/A $ N/A N/A N/A 

TOTAL LOT 1: 
Section A & B 

N/A N/A $ N/A N/A N/A 

 
LOT #2 

MAN HOLE SEWER TOPS (Lid thickness: 1 ½”) 
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED 

YEARLY 
QUANTITY 

INDIVIDUAL 
COST 

ESTIMATED 
YEARLY 
AMOUNT 

% DISCOUNT 
QTY 5 

% DISCOUNT 
QTY 15 

% DISCOUNT 
QTY 25 

23.5 INCH 50 $ $ $ $ $ 
23 5/8 INCH 25 $ $ $ $ $ 
23 ¼ INCH 50 $ $ $ $ $ 
26 INCH 60 $ $ $ $ $ 

TOTAL LOT #2 N/A N/A $ N/A N/A N/A 

 
LOT #3 
WATER VALVE BOX RISERS AND LIDS 

DESCRIPTION 
ESTIMATED 

YEARLY 
QUANTITY 

INDIVIDUAL 
COST 

ESTIMATED 
YEARLY 
AMOUNT 

% DISOUNT 
QTY 5 

% 
DISCOUNT 

QTY 15 

% DISCOUNT 
QTY 25 

1 INCH RISE-EPOXY TYPE 95 $ $ $ $ $ 
1 INCH RISE-SET SCREW 
TYPE 

95 
     

1.5 INCH RISE-EPOXY 
TYPE 

220 
$ $ $ $ $ 

1.5 INCH RISE-SET SCREW 
TYPE 

220 
     

2 INCH RISE-EPOXY TYPE 70 $ $ $ $ $ 
2 INCH RISE-SET SCREW 
TYPE 

70 
     

LIDS TO FIT WATER 
VALVE RISERS 

200 
$ $ $ $ $ 

TOTAL LOT #3 N/A N/A $ N/A N/A N/A 
 
Notes: 

1. AWARD(S) WILL BE BASED UPON THE TOTAL ESTIMATED YEARLY AMOUNT 
FOR EACH LOT. 

2. Prices quoted shall include Just-in-time delivery and all other associated delivery charges. 
Delivery to be FOB Destination. 

3. Prices quoted shall remain valid for fifteen (15) months from date of original bid. 
4. The quantities listed above indicate the estimated number of items that may be requested by the 

City from the successful bidder(s).  However, the City reserves the right to increase and/or 
decrease any of the item quantities listed in the bid pricing sheet.  Each bidder, by submitting a 
bid, hereby agrees to this provision. 

5. The City reserves the right to award by LOTS and to multiple vendors.  
6. All items must be in compliance with the 2012 Manual of Specifications and Details  
7. Delivery locations: 525 Taylor Street Lynchburg, VA 

     1700 Memorial Ave Lynchburg, VA  
8. All items listed in bid sheet should be traffic bearing.  



City of Lynchburg
Bid Tabulation Form

CITY BID NO.14-875 PROJECT NAME: Utility Risers, Sewer Tops, Fire Hydrants, Valves and Accessories
BID OPENING DATE:11/20/2013
BUYER: Lisa Moss
TABULATOR: Lisa Moss

VENDOR/CONTRACTOR

TERMS/DELIVERY
ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

LOT #1 SECTION A: MANHOLE RISERS

DESCRIPTION EST. YRLY QTY
INDIVIDUAL 

COST
EST. YRLY 

AMT
INDIVIDUA

L COST
EST. YRLY 

AMT

23.5 X 1.5 INCH RISE 150 $142.73 $21,409.50 $153.44 $23,015.70

23.5 X 2 INCH RISE 75 $142.73 $10,704.75 $153.44 $11,507.78

23 5/8 X 1.5 INCH RISE 60 $142.73 $8,563.80 $33.75 $2,025.00

23 5/8 X 2 INCH RISE 60 $142.73 $8,563.80 $40.00 $2,400.00

23 1/4 X 1.5 INCH RISE 150 $142.73 $21,409.50 $62.50 $9,375.00

23 1/4  X 2 INCH RISE 75 $142.73 $10,704.75 $68.75 $5,156.25

26 X 1.5 INCH RISE 160 $153.79 $24,606.40 $55.00 $8,800.00

26 X 1 INCH RISE 75 $153.79 $11,534.25 NO BID 0

26 X 2 INCH RISE 60 $153.79 $9,227.40 $60.00 $3,600.00

$126,724.15 $65,879.73

SECTION B: LAMP STACK RISERS

DESCRIPTION EST. YRLY QTY
INDIVIDUAL 

COST
EST. YRLY 

AMT
INDIVIDUA

L COST
EST. YRLY 

AMT

10.5 X 1 INCH RISE 50 $97.83 $4,891.50 $105.16 $5,258.15

10.5 X 1.5 INCH RISE 60 $97.83 $5,869.80 $105.16 $6,309.78

10.5 X 2 INCH RISE 50 $97.83 $4,891.50 $105.16 $5,258.15

12 X 1 INCH RISE 50 $97.83 $4,891.50 $117.40 $5,870.00

12 X 1.5 INCH RISE 50 $109.21 $5,460.50 $117.40 $5,870.00

12 X 2 INCH RISE 50 $109.21 $5,460.50 $117.40 $5,870.00

$31,465.30 $34,436.08

$158,189.45 $100,315.81

LOT #2 MANHOLE SEWER TOPS

DESCRIPTION EST. YRLY QTY
INDIVIDUAL 

COST
EST. YRLY 

AMT
INDIVIDUA

L COST
EST. YRLY 

AMT

23.5 INCH 50 $133.72 $6,686.00 $143.75 $7,187.50

23 5/8 INCH 25 NO BID $0.00 $100.00 $2,500.00

23 1/4 INCH 50 $136.05 $6,802.50 $112.50 $5,625.00

26 INCH 60 $109.88 $6,592.80 $156.25 $9,375.00

$20,081.30 $24,687.50

LOT #3 WATER VALVE BOX RISERS/LIDS

DESCRIPTION EST. YRLY QTY
INDIVIDUAL 

COST
EST. YRLY 

AMT
INDIVIDUA

L COST
EST. YRLY 

AMT

1 INCH RISE- SET SCREW TYPE 95 NO BID $0.00 4.787 $454.77

1 INCH RISE -EPOXY TYPE 95 $31.79 $3,020.05 $34.18 $3,246.63

1.5 INCH RISE- EPOXY TYPE 220 NO BID $0.00 $7.46 $1,641.86

1.5 INCH RISE- SET SCREW TYPE 220 $36.17 $7,957.40 $38.89 $8,555.36

2 INCH RISE- EPOXY TYPE 70 NO BID $0.00 $10.78 $754.25

2 INCH RISE- SET SCREW TYPE 70 $39.47 $2,762.90 $42.43 $2,969.75

LIDS TO FIT WATER VALVE RISERS 200 $16.44 $3,288.00 $7.58 $1,515.00

$17,028.35 $19,137.61

AWARD TO: FERGUSON

LOWEST BIDDER?   YES      IF NO, JUSTIFICATION IS: 

PREPARED BY:  Lisa Moss                        Date: 11/21/2013

APPROVED BY: DENNIS REYNOLDS      Date: 11/25/13

TOTAL SECTION A:

TOTAL SECTION B

TOTAL LOT 1:( SECT. A & B):

TOTAL LOT #2

TOTAL LOT #3

SEALED BID:         X

YES
YES

UNSEALED BID:

HD Supply Waterworks, Inc

YES
YES

Ferguson


