
City of Lynchburg
Bid Tabulation Form

CITY BID NO.14-920 PROJECT NAME: Utility Risers, Sewer Tops and accessories
BID OPENING DATE:06/26/2014
BUYER: Lisa Moss
TABULATOR: Lisa Moss

VENDOR/CONTRACTOR

TERMS/DELIVERY
ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

LOT #1

DESCRIPTION
EST. YRLY 

QTY
INDIVIDUAL 

COST EST. YRLY AMT
INDIVIDUAL 

COST EST. YRLY AMT
INDIVIDUAL 

COST
EST. YRLY 

AMT
23.5 X 1.5 INCH RISE 150 $90.00 $13,500.00 NO BID $0.00 $147.50 $22,125.00
23.5 X 2 INCH RISE 75 $90.00 $6,750.00 NO BID $0.00 $147.50 $11,062.50
23 5/8 X 1.5 INCH RISE 60 $90.00 $5,400.00 $33.75 $2,025.00 $147.50 $8,850.00

23 5/8 X 2 INCH RISE 60 $90.00 $5,400.00 $40.00 $2,400.00 $147.50 $8,850.00
23 1/4 X 1.5 INCH RISE 150 $90.00 $13,500.00 $62.50 $9,375.00 $147.50 $22,125.00

23 1/4  X 2 INCH RISE 75 $90.00 $6,750.00 $68.75 $5,156.25 $147.50 $11,062.50

26 X 1.5 INCH RISE 160 $90.00 $14,400.00 $55.00 $8,800.00 $150.30 $24,048.00

26 X 1 INCH RISE 75 $90.00 $6,750.00 NO BID 0 150.3 $11,272.50

26 X 2 INCH RISE 60 $90.00 $5,400.00 $60.00 $3,600.00 $150.30 $9,018.00

$77,850.00 $31,356.25 $128,413.50

LOT #1

DESCRIPTION
EST. YRLY 

QTY
INDIVIDUAL 

COST EST. YRLY AMT
INDIVIDUAL 

COST EST. YRLY AMT
INDIVIDUAL 

COST
EST. YRLY 

AMT
23.5 X 1.5 INCH RISE 150 $88.50 $13,275.00 $162.46 $24,369.00 No Bid $0.00
23.5 X 2 INCH RISE 75 $92.00 $6,900.00 $162.46 $12,184.50 No Bid $0.00
23 5/8 X 1.5 INCH RISE 60 $88.50 $5,310.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

23 5/8 X 2 INCH RISE 60 $92.00 $5,520.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

23 1/4 X 1.5 INCH RISE 150 $88.50 $13,275.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

23 1/4  X 2 INCH RISE 75 $92.00 $6,900.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
26 X 1.5 INCH RISE 160 $88.50 $14,160.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
26 X 1 INCH RISE 75 $85.00 $6,375.00 No Bid 0 No Bid 0
26 X 2 INCH RISE 60 $92.00 $5,520.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

$77,235.00 $36,553.50 $0.00

$155,085.00 $67,909.75 $128,413.50

SECTION B: LAMP STACK RISERS

DESCRIPTION
EST. YRLY 

QTY
INDIVIDUAL 

COST
EST. YRLY 

AMT
INDIVIDUAL 

COST
EST. YRLY 

AMT
INDIVIDUAL 

COST
EST. YRLY 

AMT

10.5 X 1 INCH RISE 50 $44.00 $2,200.00 $105.16 $5,258.00 $95.60 $4,780.00

10.5 X 1.5 INCH RISE 60 $45.00 $2,700.00 $105.16 $6,309.78 $95.60 $5,736.00

10.5 X 2 INCH RISE 50 $46.00 $2,300.00 $105.16 $5,258.15 $95.60 $4,780.00

12 X 1 INCH RISE 50 $47.00 $2,350.00 $117.40 $5,870.00 $106.73 $5,336.50

12 X 1.5 INCH RISE 50 $48.00 $2,400.00 $117.40 $5,870.00 $106.73 $5,336.50

12 X 2 INCH RISE 50 $49.00 $2,450.00 $117.40 $5,870.00 $106.73 $5,336.50
$14,400.00 $34,435.93 $31,305.50

$169,485.00 $102,345.68 $159,719.00

LOT #2 MANHOLE SEWER TOPS

DESCRIPTION
EST. YRLY 

QTY
INDIVIDUAL 

COST
EST. YRLY 

AMT
INDIVIDUAL 

COST
EST. YRLY 

AMT
INDIVIDUAL 

COST
EST. YRLY 

AMT

23.5 INCH 50 NO BID $0.00 $93.75 $4,687.50 $130.68 $6,534.00

23 5/8 INCH 25 NO BID $0.00 $145.50 $3,637.50 $132.95 $3,323.75

23 1/4 INCH 50 NO BID $0.00 $118.12 $5,906.00 $107.39 $5,369.50

26 INCH 60 NO BID $0.00 $125.00 $7,500.00 $145.00 $8,700.00

$0.00 $21,731.00 $23,927.25

LOT #3 WATER VALVE BOX RISERS/LIDS

DESCRIPTION
EST. YRLY 

QTY
INDIVIDUAL 

COST
EST. YRLY 

AMT
INDIVIDUAL 

COST
EST. YRLY 

AMT
INDIVIDUAL 

COST
EST. YRLY 

AMT

1 INCH RISE- SET SCREW TYPE 95 $9.00 $855.00 34.17 $3,246.15 No Bid $0.00

1 INCH RISE -EPOXY TYPE 95 $19.00 $1,805.00 $4.79 $455.05 $31.07 $2,951.65

1.5 INCH RISE- EPOXY TYPE 220 $10.00 $2,200.00 $7.46 $1,641.20 No Bid $0.00

1.5 INCH RISE- SET SCREW TYPE 220 $20.00 $4,400.00 $38.89 $8,555.36 $35.35 $7,777.00

2 INCH RISE- EPOXY TYPE 70 $11.00 $770.00 $10.77 $753.90 No Bid $0.00

2 INCH RISE- SET SCREW TYPE 70 $21.00 $1,470.00 $42.42 $2,969.40 $38.57 $2,699.90

LIDS TO FIT WATER VALVE RISERS 200 $12.00 $2,400.00 $7.57 $1,514.00 $16.07 $3,214.00

$13,900.00 $19,135.06 $16,642.55
AWARD TO:  Lot 1 and Lot 3: American Highway Products, Lot 2 Ferguson

LOWEST BIDDER?   YES    IF NO, JUSTIFICATION IS: 

PREPARED BY:  Lisa Moss                        Date: 06/27/2014

APPROVED BY:  DENNIS REYNOLDS     Date: 7/7/14

TOTAL SECTION A:

TOTAL SECTION B

TOTAL LOT 1:( SECT. A & B)

TOTAL LOT #2

TOTAL LOT #3

SEALED BID:         X

SECTION A1: MANHOLE RISERS- Solid Fabricated Steel

SECTION A2: MANHOLE RISERS- Steel Expandable 

TOTAL SECTION A2:

TOTAL SECTION A (A1 & A2

Consolidated Pipe & Supply 
Co

YES
YES

YES
YES

UNSEALED BID:

American Highway Products

YES
YES

Ferguson


