
City of Lynchburg
Bid Tabulation Form

CITY BID NO : 2016-034 PROJECT NAME: Security Camera System and Installation at multiple Lynchburg City Schools
BID OPENING DATE:11/30/2015
BUYER: Lisa Moss
TABULATOR: Lisa Moss

VENDOR/CONTRACTOR
TERMS/DELIVERY
ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

QUANTITY TYPE INDIVIDUAL 
PRICING

TOTAL 
PRICING 

INDIVIDUAL 
PRICING

TOTAL 
PRICING 

INDIVIDUAL 
PRICING

TOTAL 
PRICING 

110 Sony SNC-XM631 $337.64 $37,140.40 $269.95 $29,694.50 $335.99 $36,958.90

60 Sony SNC-
EM632RC $860.38

$51,622.80
$679.95 $40,797.00 $856.16 $51,369.60

170 OC ENT 1C No Bid No Bid $129.00 $21,930.00 $172.51 $29,326.70

170 No Bid No Bid $26.52 $4,508.40 $30.05 $5,108.50
$88,763.20 $96,929.90 $122,763.70

SEALED BID:         X
UNSEALED BID:

DESCRIPTION

2.1 Megapixel 
2.1 Megapixel 
Outdoor Dome 
Camera
Ocularis IS 
Camera License
Ocularis IS 

YES
YES

SECTION B: ALTERNATE PRODUCT

Yes
Yes

No Alternate offeredNo Alternate offered

ALTERNATE PRODUCT DESCRIPTION: **PRODUCT MUST MEET 
OR EXCEED PROJECT REQUIREMENTS IN ORDER TO BE 

CONSIDERED**THERE IS NO GUARANTEE OF ACCEPTANCE OF 
ALTERNATE.

CDW Government, LLC
Yes
No

No Alternate offered

SECTION A:CAMERAS AND LICENSING

TOTAL SECTION A BASE BID: 

Moores Electrical and Mechanical 
Construcing, Inc. Crist Communications, Inc.



City of Lynchburg
Bid Tabulation Form

CITY BID NO : 2016-034 PROJECT NAME: Security Camera System and Installation at multiple Lynchburg City Schools
BID OPENING DATE:11/30/2015
BUYER: Lisa Moss
TABULATOR: Lisa Moss

VENDOR/CONTRACTOR
TERMS/DELIVERY
ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

SEALED BID:         X
UNSEALED BID:

YES
YES

Yes
Yes

CDW Government, LLC
Yes
No

Moores Electrical and Mechanical 
Construcing, Inc. Crist Communications, Inc.

Quantity Type Description Individual Pricing Total Pricing Individual 
Pricing Total Pricing Individual 

Pricing
Total 
Pricing

2 Sony SNC-
EM632RC

2.1 Megapixel 
Outdoor Dome 
Camera

$860.38 $1,720.76 $679.95 $1,359.90 No Bid No Bid

2 OC ENT 1C Ocularis IS Camera 
License

No bid No Bid $129.00 $258.00 No bid No Bid

No Bid $468.92 No Bid

$1,720.76 $2,086.82 No Bid

   
COMMENTS

AWARD TO:  Crist Communication
LOWEST BIDDER?  Yes      ***IF NO, JUSTIFICATION IS: 
PREPARED BY:  Lisa Moss                        Date: 12/01/2015
APPROVED BY: Ben Copeland         Date: 12/17/2015

LOCATION

W.M. Bass Elementary

Linkhorne Elementary
Paul Munro Elementary
Perrymont Elementary

Bedford Hills Elementary
Dearington Elementary 
Heritage Elementary

T. C. Miller Elementary
Hutcherson Early Learning Center
Fort Hill Community School

R. S. Payne Elementary
Sandusky Elementary
Sheffield Elementary

BASE BID TOTAL (Sections A & B) $88,763.20 

Heritage High School **
TOTAL SECTION B:

$6,430.88
$4,766.26

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

$238.34
$801.72
$749.41
$650.97

$1,058.18

TOTAL INSTALLATION COST FOR OPTIONAL CAMERAS. This shall include all work, 
materials, labor, configuration.  ONSSI recording server setup.

                                 TOTAL (OPTIONAL –NO GUARANTEE OF AWARD)

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

$436.82
$671.99
$873.63
$659.48

No Bid

$28,623.05

$125,552.95 

SECTION C: INSTALLATION

2558.18
$849.45

2558.18

TOTAL COST, PER SCHOOL, FOR INSTALLATION:

$59,729.54

$182,493.24 

Two Optional Cameras for Fort Hill Community Center: *These are not considered as part of the base bid and should not be included in the total for Base Bid.  

(This shall include all work, materials, labor, training, configuration (ONSSI recording server setup per site), lifts 
and other items necessary to complete the project. (Cameras Priced separately)

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

$7,877.74


