
City of Lynchburg
Bid Tabulation Form

CITY BID NO. 2016-041 PROJECT NAME: Electrical Contracting Services
BID OPENING DATE: 01/06/2016

TABULATOR:Lisa Moss

VENDOR/CONTRACTOR
ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT Yes Yes Yes No Yes

RATE PER EXTENDED RATE PER EXTENDED RATE PER EXTENDED RATE PER EXTENDED RATE PER EXTENDED
DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT HOUR PRICE HOUR PRICE HOUR PRICE HOUR PRICE HOUR PRICE

Labor Rate: Regular Time Electrician 135 HR $38.00 $5,130.00 $50.00 $6,750.00 $55.82 $7,535.70 $68.00 $9,180.00 $95.00 $12,825.00
Labor Rate: Regular Time Helper 160 HR $34.00 $5,440.00 $35.00 $5,600.00 $41.85 $6,696.00 $55.00 $8,800.00 $40.00 $6,400.00

BASE BID TOTAL: TOTAL: $10,570.00 $12,350.00 $14,231.70 $17,980.00 $19,225.00
Additive Bid Items
Bucket Truck 20 HR $60.00 $1,200.00 NO BID NO BID $49.70 $994.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Line/Auger Truck 20 HR $65.00 $1,300.00 NO BID NO BID $62.85 $1,257.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pavement Saw 24 HR $11.00 $264.00 NO BID NO BID $16.85 $404.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Air Compressor  24 HR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $28.90 $693.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Utility Truck 16 HR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $31.10 $497.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Boring Machine 16 HR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $122.50 $1,960.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Trenching Machine 12 HR $35.00 $420.00 NO BID NO BID $55.85 $670.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

COMMENTS
AWARD TO: Armstrong Electric, A & L Electrical, J. B. Moore Electrical Contractor, Inc.
LOWEST BIDDER?   yes         ***IF NO, JUSTIFICATION IS:
PREPARED BY:  LISA MOSS                       Date:1/7/2016
APPROVED BY:   Randy Dalton                   Date: 01/11/2016

Unlimited Electrical 
Contracting, Inc.

BUYER: Lisa Moss
UNSEALED BID: 
SEALED BID:    X        

Armstrong Electric 
Company, Inc. A & L Electrical, Inc.

J. B. Moore Electrical 
Contractor, Inc Hickey Electric Company


