City of Lynchburg
Bid Tabulation Form

CITY BID NO : 2016-043 PROJECT NAME: Candlers Mountain, Huntingwood and Mill Lane Reservoirs Maintenance
BID OPENING DATE:02/03/2016 UNSEALED BID: ‘
BUYER: Lisa Moss SEALED BID: X
TABULATOR: Lisa Moss
\
. - Eastern Tank & . . .
. D & M Painting Worldwide i~ . Nostos SS Titan Industrial Manolis
AMP Industrial Corporation Industries, Corp. U“I'tyl :irwces, Contractors, LLC Services Painting, Inc.
VENDOR/CONTRACTOR |
TERMS/DELIVERY Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT Y N Y Y Y Y Y
BID BOND Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
SECTION 1 |DESCRIPTION TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
030100.01 [REPAIR PIPE SUPPORTS-CANDLERS MTN $2,350.00 $ 2,800.00 $3,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,800.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00
TOTAL SECTION 1 $2,350.00 $ 2,800.00 $3,000.00 $3,500.00 $ 3,800.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00
SECTION 2
0500 00 I,\_AETVNEL INDICATOR REMOVAL-CANDLERS $1,300.00 $ 750.00 $1,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $3,000.00
05 0000 SCREEN REPLACEMENT-CANDLERS MTN $4,650.00 $ 28,600.00 $32,600.00 $21,000.00 $23,500.00 $41,000.00 $22,000.00
TOTAL SECTION 2 $5,950.00 $ 29,350.00 $33,600.00 $23,500.00 $ 26,000.00 $46,000.00 $25,000.00
SECTION 3
WET INTERIOR REPAINT-HUNTINGWOOD $224,310.00 $ 335,500.00 $319,600.00 $360,000.00 $435,500.00 $310,103.00 $463,500.00
099713 NO ACCESS SHEET ALLOWED
EXTERIOR SIDEWALL OVERCOAT-
099713 CANDLERS MTN $34,327.00 $ 58,760.00 $63,600.00 $112,000.00 $94,200.00 $200,051.00 $142,000.00
099713 ;E_?NM SEALER-BASEPLATE-CANDLERS $900.00 $ 1,700.00 $4,100.00 $3,500.00 $4,500.00 $5,000.00 $3,800.00
099713 EXTERIOR CLEANING-MILL LANE $44,366.00 $ 22,400.00 $47,000.00 $8,000.00 $22,500.00 $33,806.00 $56,500.00
TOTAL SECTION 3 $303,903.00 $  418,360.00 $434,300.00 $483,500.00 | $ 556,700.00 | $548,960.00 $665,800.00
SECTION 4
CATHODIC PROTECTION SYSTEM-
26 42 23 CANDLERS MTN $26,838.00 $ 18,500.00 $21,200.00 $18,000.00 $27,500.00 $21,000.00 $32,000.00
TOTAL SECTION 4 $26,838.00 $ 18,500.00 $21,200.00 $18,000.00 $ 27,500.00 $21,000.00 $32,000.00
TOTAL BASE BID (SECTIONS 1-4)| $339,041.00 |$ 469,010.00 | $492,100.00 $528,500.00 | $ 614,000.00 | $620,960.00 | $737,800.00
DEDUCT ALTERNATE: Replaces Section 3: 09 97 13 Wet Interior Repaint-Huntingwood No Access Sheet Allowed Line Item with:
WET INTERIOR REPAINT-HUNTINGWOOD WITH . .
099713 ACCESS DOOR SHEET $224,310.00 $331,500.00 $309,600.00 No Bid No Bid $333,243.00 $478,500.00
INSPECTION ALLOWANCE $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00
TOTAL DEDUCT ALTERNATE:| $227,310.00 $334,500.00 $312,600.00 No Bid No Bid $336,243.00 $481,500.00
COMMENTS
AWARD TO:

LOWEST BIDDER?
JUSTIFICATION IS:

***IF NO,

PREPARED BY: LISA MOSS
Date:2/4/2016

APPROVED BY:

Date:




