
City of Lynchburg
Bid Tabulation Form

CITY BID NO : 14-921 PROJECT NAME: Laptops for CVGS
BID OPENING DATE:06/25/14
BUYER: Lisa Moss
TABULATOR: Lisa Moss

VENDOR/CONTRACTOR
TERMS/DELIVERY
ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT
COMPUTER SPECIFIED

Quantity Type
Individual 

Cost Total Cost
Individual 

Cost Total Cost
Individual 

Cost Total Cost Individual Cost Total Cost
Individual 

Cost Total Cost
130 Computer $550.00 $71,500.00 $871.54 $113,300.20 $565.00 $73,450.00 $999.00 $129,870.00 $1,396.01 $181,481.30
130 Warranty $75.00 $9,750.00 $266.00 $34,580.00 $94.00 $12,220.00 $127.20 $16,536.00 Included Included

TOTAL BASE BID $81,250.00 $147,880.20 $85,670.00 $146,406.00 $181,481.30

COMMENTS
AWARD TO:  Computer Upgrade King, LLC
LOWEST BIDDER?   yes                 IF NO, JUSTIFICATION IS:
PREPARED BY:  Lisa Moss                        Date: 06/27/2014
APPROVED BY:  Steve Smith      Date: 7/1/14

Dell

CDW Government, LLC
Yes
No

SEALED BID:         X
UNSEALED BID:

Attronica
 Yes
Yes

Software Productivity 
Strategists, Inc

Yes
Yes

Lenovo HP Lenovo HP

Continental Resources, 
Inc
Yes
No

Nomar Enterprises, LLC 
dba Rugged Depot

Yes
Yes



City of Lynchburg
Bid Tabulation Form

Individual 
Cost Total Cost

Individual 
Cost Total Cost

Individual 
Cost Total Cost

Individual 
Cost Total Cost

Individual 
Cost Total Cost

Individual 
Cost Total Cost

Individual 
Cost Total Cost

Individual 
Cost Total Cost

$654.99 $85,148.70 $532.97 $69,286.10 $550.00 $71,500.00 $575.00 $74,750.00 $571.90 $74,347.00 $639.94 $83,192.20 $788.60 $102,518.00 $588.15 $76,459.50

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $60.00 $7,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $120.85 $15,710.50 $111.68 $14,518.40

$85,148.70 $69,286.10 $79,300.00 $74,750.00 $74,347.00 $83,192.20 $118,228.50 $90,977.90

GP Tech Solutions
Yes
No
HP

Eastern Data Inc
Yes
No

Lenovo

OM Office Supply Inc
Yes
Yes

Lenovo

SDF Computers Inc
Yes
No

Lenovo
Yes
Dell

SBC Technology 
Partners, Inc

Yes
No

Lenovo

Computers America, Inc
Yes
No

Lenovo

Networking Technologies 
and Support Inc

Yes
No

Fujitsu

Electronic Systems, Inc
Yes
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Individual 
Cost Total Cost

Individual 
Cost Total Cost

Individual 
Cost Total Cost

Individual 
Cost Total Cost

Individual 
Cost Total Cost

Individual 
Cost Total Cost

Individual 
Cost Total Cost

$607.00 $78,910.00 $1,299.00 $168,870.00 $607.00 $78,910.00 $845.00 $109,850.00 $1,099.99 $142,998.70 $524.99 $68,248.70 $840.48 $109,262.40

$93.00 $12,090.00 No Bid No Bid $93.00 $12,090.00 No Bid No Bid $157.99 $20,538.70 $85.00 $11,050.00 No Bid No Bid

$91,000.00 $168,870.00 $91,000.00 $109,850.00 $163,537.40 $79,298.70 $109,262.40

Asyncrob Corp
Yes
No
HP

EcomNets, Inc
Yes
Yes

Lenovo

Computer Upgrade King, 
LLC
Yes
Yes

Lenovo

Advanced Logic Industries, 
Inc
Yes
Yes
HP

Summit Business Associates, 
Inc
Yes
No

Lenovo

David Horton Logistics
Yes
No
HP

Advanced Logistics, Inc
Yes
Yes
HP
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Individual 
Cost Total Cost

Individual 
Cost Total Cost

Individual 
Cost Total Cost

$580.00 $75,400.00 $818.25 $106,372.50 $679.00 $88,270.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$75,400.00 $106,372.50 $88,270.00

Yes
No

Dell

Definitive Results, LLC Bytespeed, LLC
Yes
No

ByteSpeed

Tri State Camera
Yes
No

Lenovo


