
City of Lynchburg
Bid Tabulation Form

CITY BID NO.15-950 PROJECT NAME:  Emergency Generator Preventative Maintenance
BID OPENING DATE: 12/18/2014
BUYER: Lisa Moss
TABULATOR: Lisa Moss

VENDOR/CONTRACTOR
TERMS/DELIVERY
ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

Location June Invoice
November 

Invoice
Drain and Fill 

Coolant
Annual Price 
(June & Nov) June Invoice

November 
Invoice

Drain and Fill 
Coolant

Annual Price 
(June & Nov) June Invoice

Public Safety Bldg $277.25 $672.25 NO BID $949.50 $450.00 $450.00 $168.00 $900.00 $335.00

Public Safety Bldg $317.25 $762.25 NO BID $1,079.50 $450.00 $450.00 $168.00 $900.00 $335.00

City Hall Bldg $225.25 $722.25 NO BID $947.50 $350.00 $350.00 $60.00 $700.00 $335.00

City Gas Pumps $277.25 $669.25 NO BID $946.50 $350.00 $350.00 $85.00 $700.00 $335.00

Public Works Bldg $262.25 $572.25 NO BID $834.50 $350.00 $350.00 $60.00 $700.00 $335.00

Fleet Bldg $417.25 $1,232.25 NO BID $1,649.50 $700.00 $700.00 $360.00 $1,400.00 $585.00

Human Services $297.25 $722.25 NO BID $1,019.50 $400.00 $400.00 $164.00 $800.00 $360.00

Fire Station #4 $252.25 $574.25 NO BID $826.50 $350.00 $350.00 $85.00 $700.00 $335.00

Fire Station #8 $282.25 $574.25 NO BID $856.50 $350.00 $350.00 $75.00 $700.00 $335.00

Fire Station #7 Maint. Shop $262.25 $574.25 NO BID $836.50 $350.00 $350.00 $60.00 $700.00 $335.00

Fire Admin Bldg $262.25 $574.25 NO BID $836.50 $350.00 $350.00 $60.00 $700.00 $335.00

Bldg Maintenance $262.25 $574.25 NO BID $836.50 $350.00 $350.00 $90.00 $700.00 $335.00

Bldg Maintenance $262.25 $574.25 NO BID $836.50 $350.00 $350.00 $90.00 $700.00 $335.00

West Bldg $262.25 $574.25 NO BID $836.50 $350.00 $350.00 $75.00 $700.00 $335.00

Public Library $262.25 $574.25 NO BID $836.50 $350.00 $350.00 $75.00 $700.00 $335.00

IT Building $262.25 $574.25 NO BID $836.50 $400.00 $400.00 $164.00 $800.00 $410.00

YES
YES

F

SEALED BID:         X
UNSEALED BID:

WESTERN BRANCH DIESEL

YES
YES

BAY DIESEL CORPORATION



City of Lynchburg
Bid Tabulation Form

November 
Invoice

Drain and 
Fill 

Coolant

Annual Price 
(June & 

Nov)
June 

Invoice
November 

Invoice

Drain and 
Fill 

Coolant

Annual Price 
(June & 

Nov)

$380.00 $280.00 $715.00 $434.95 $736.14 $434.95 $1,171.09

$380.00 $280.00 $715.00 $434.95 $736.14 $434.95 $1,171.09

$360.00 $155.00 $695.00 $325.70 $505.40 $168.47 $831.10

$380.00 $155.00 $715.00 $325.70 $505.40 $168.47 $831.10

$300.00 $155.00 $635.00 $325.70 $505.40 $168.47 $831.10

$830.00 $380.00 $1,415.00 $836.20 $1,633.60 $537.05 $2,469.80

$370.00 $280.00 $730.00 $459.45 $620.77 $434.95 $1,080.22

$300.00 $155.00 $635.00 $325.70 $505.40 $168.47 $831.10

$280.00 $155.00 $615.00 $325.70 $505.40 $168.47 $831.10

$300.00 $155.00 $635.00 $325.70 $505.40 $168.47 $831.10

$310.00 $155.00 $645.00 $325.70 $505.40 $168.47 $831.10

$300.00 $230.00 $635.00 $325.70 $505.40 $168.47 $831.10

$300.00 $230.00 $635.00 $325.70 $505.40 $168.47 $831.10

$300.00 $230.00 $635.00 $325.70 $505.40 $168.47 $831.10

$300.00 $230.00 $635.00 $325.70 $505.40 $434.95 $831.10

$390.00 $380.00 $800.00 $459.45 $620.77 $434.95 $1,080.22

IDELITY POWER SYSTEMS

YES
YES

CARTER MACHINERY COMPANY INC

YES
YES



City of Lynchburg
Bid Tabulation Form

CITY BID NO.15-950 PROJECT NAME:  Emergency Generator Preventative Maintenance
BID OPENING DATE: 12/18/2014
BUYER: Lisa Moss
TABULATOR: Lisa Moss

VENDOR/CONTRACTOR
TERMS/DELIVERY
ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

YES
YES

F

SEALED BID:         X
UNSEALED BID:

WESTERN BRANCH DIESEL

YES
YES

BAY DIESEL CORPORATION

IT Building $262.25 $574.25 NO BID $836.50 $400.00 $400.00 $164.00 $800.00 $335.00

Salvation Army $307.25 $712.25 NO BID $1,019.50 $400.00 $400.00 $164.00 $800.00 $335.00

College Hill Filter Plant $262.25 $574.25 NO BID $836.50 $800.00 $800.00 $500.00 $1,600.00 $645.00

Abert Filter Plant $262.25 $574.25 NO BID $836.50 $400.00 $400.00 $210.00 $800.00 $360.00

Mill Lane Pump Station $762.25 $837.25 NO BID $1,599.50 $800.00 $800.00 $500.00 $1,600.00 $835.00

Abert Clearwell Pump $297.25 $722.25 NO BID $1,019.50 $450.00 $450.00 $185.00 $900.00 $410.00

Wingate Pump Station $297.25 $722.25 NO BID $1,019.50 $450.00 $450.00 $210.00 $900.00 $360.00

Carroll Ave Pump $467.25 $882.25 NO BID $1,349.50 $600.00 $600.00 $240.00 $1,200.00 $510.00

Detention Home $297.25 $722.25 NO BID $1,019.50 $400.00 $400.00 $185.00 $800.00 $410.00

Terminal Bldg $467.25 $882.25 NO BID $1,349.50 $600.00 $600.00 $240.00 $1,200.00 $510.00

Airfield Vault $297.25 $722.25 NO BID $1,019.50 $400.00 $400.00 $164.00 $800.00 $335.00

Airfield Maintenance $297.25 $722.25 NO BID $1,019.50 $400.00 $400.00 $164.00 $800.00 $410.00

City Armory $262.25 $674.25 NO BID $936.50 $250.00 $250.00 $60.00 $500.00 $335.00

Lyncom $297.25 $722.25 NO BID $1,019.50 $450.00 $450.00 $185.00 $900.00 $410.00

BID AMOUNT $29,846.00 $26,100.00

RegRegular Time Rate P/hr: $95Regular Time Rate P/hr: $105.00



City of Lynchburg
Bid Tabulation Form

IDELITY POWER SYSTEMS

YES
YES

CARTER MACHINERY COMPANY INC

YES
YES

$300.00 $280.00 $635.00 $434.95 $736.14 $434.95 $1,171.09

$300.00 $280.00 $635.00 $434.95 $736.14 $827.01 $1,171.09

$535.00 $880.00 $1,180.00 $944.43 $1,303.81 $434.95 $2,248.24

$310.00 $280.00 $670.00 $434.95 $736.14 $2,246.22 $1,171.09

$1,080.00 $980.00 $1,915.00 $1,700.99 $1,801.04 $434.95 $3,502.03

$390.00 $380.00 $800.00 $434.95 $736.14 $434.95 $1,171.09

$370.00 $280.00 $730.00 $434.95 $736.14 $434.95 $1,171.09

$445.00 $380.00 $955.00 $459.45 $620.77 $736.14 $1,080.22

$390.00 $380.00 $800.00 $545.21 $763.21 $434.95 $1,308.42

$435.00 $380.00 $945.00 $459.45 $620.77 $434.95 $1,080.22

$360.00 $280.00 $695.00 $399.21 $608.52 $434.95 $1,007.73

$390.00 $380.00 $800.00 $459.45 $620.77 $168.47 $1,080.22

$310.00 $155.00 $645.00 $325.70 $505.40 $434.95 $831.10

$390.00 $380.00 $800.00 $545.21 $763.21 $603.42 $1,308.42

$23,695.00 $35,416.57

Regular Time Rate P/hr: $125.00gular Time Rate P/hr: $115.00



City of Lynchburg
Bid Tabulation Form

CITY BID NO.15-950 PROJECT NAME:  Emergency Generator Preventative Maintenance
BID OPENING DATE: 12/18/2014
BUYER: Lisa Moss
TABULATOR: Lisa Moss

VENDOR/CONTRACTOR
TERMS/DELIVERY
ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

YES
YES

F

SEALED BID:         X
UNSEALED BID:

WESTERN BRANCH DIESEL

YES
YES

BAY DIESEL CORPORATION

COMMENTS
AWARD TO: Fidelty
LOWEST BIDDER?  yes            IF NO, JUSTIFICATION IS: 
PREPARED BY:  Lisa Moss                        Date: 12/19/2014
APPROVED BY:            Date: 

Other Materi

Warranty on Labor: 60

O

Saturda

Mfg Publis

W

W

Overtime Rate P/hr: $140

Saturday, Sunday or Holiday P/hr: $170

 Mfg Published Price List Less % Discount: 10%

Other Material Actual Cost plus % for Admin. Costs Only: 
20%

Warranty on Parts: MFG Warranty

Overtime Rate P/hr: $157.50

Saturday, Sunday or Holiday P/hr: $210.00

 Mfg Published Price List Less % Discount: 20%

Other Material Actual Cost plus % for Admin. Costs Only: 
25%

Warranty on Parts: MFG Warranty

Warranty on Labor: 6 months



City of Lynchburg
Bid Tabulation Form

IDELITY POWER SYSTEMS

YES
YES

CARTER MACHINERY COMPANY INC

YES
YES

ial Actual Cost plus % for Admin. Costs 
Only: 0%

Warranty on Labor:  1 year

Warranty on Parts: MFG Warranty Cat 12 
months

Other Material Actual Cost plus % for Admin. 
Costs Only: 25%

 Mfg Published Price List Less % Discount: 0

Saturday, Sunday or Holiday P/hr: $235.00

Overtime Rate P/hr: $180.00Overtime Rate P/hr: $172.50

y, Sunday or Holiday P/hr: $230.00

shed Price List Less % Discount: 10%

Warranty on Parts: 90 Days 

Warranty on Labor: 90 Days


