CITY OF LYNCHBURG - TABULATION - LIGHT DUTY VEHICLES - FLEET SERVICES REPLACEMENT VEHICLES

IFB # 14-884 - BID OPENING 12/10/2013 - 2:00P.M.
Intermediate Sedan Intermediate Sedan Intermediate Sedan Intermediate Sedan Intermediate Sedan Intermediate Sedan
Page 20 Page 20 Page 20 Page 20 Page 20 Page 20
MULTIPLE DEPT. - EMIS MULTIPLE DEPT. - EMIS MULTIPLE DEPT. - EMIS MULTIPLE DEPT. - EMIS MULTIPLE DEPT. - EMIS MULTIPLE DEPT. - EMIS
BERGLUND TOYOTA CAPITAL GMC TRUCK RK CHEVROLET BILLY CRAFT CHRYSLER Dominion of Bedford Fairfax Hyundai Inc
2014 Toyota, Prius Il 2014 Chevy Malibu 2014 Chevy Malibu 2014 Chrysler/200 LX 2014 Hyundai/Sonata GLS
$23,620.05 $18,998.00 $18,990.00 $17,990.00 $0.00 $21,051.00

Serv. Manual NO BID Serv. Manual NO BID Serv. Manual $0.00 Serv. Manual $0.00 Serv. Manual $0.00| Serv. Manual $0.00
BID PRICE | $23,620.05 BID PRICE $18,998.00 BID PRICE $18,990.00 BID PRICE $17,990.00 BID PRICE $0.00 BID PRICE | $21,051.00

Intermediate Sedan

Page 20
MULTIPLE DEPT. - EMIS

BERGLUND TOYOTA

2014 Toyota, Camry

$20,896.91

Serv. Manual NO BID

BID PRICE | $20,896.91

ALTERNATE BID

ALTERNATE BID

ALTERNATE BID

ALTERNATE BID

ALTERNATE BID

ALTERNATE BID

Page 20 Page 20 Page 20 Page 20 Page 20 Page 20
MULTIPLE DEPT. - EMIS MULTIPLE DEPT. - EMIS MULTIPLE DEPT. - EMIS MULTIPLE DEPT. - EMIS MULTIPLE DEPT. - EMIS MULTIPLE DEPT. - EMIS
BERGLUND TOYOTA CAPITAL GMC TRUCK RK CHEVROLET BILLY CRAFT CHRYSLER Dominion of Bedford Fairfax Hyundai Inc

2014 Toyota, Corolla LE 2014 Chevy, Cruze LS 2014 Dodge/Dart SE 2014 Dodge/Dart SE
$17,700.00 $0.00 $16,880.00 $18,159.00 $18,547.00 $0.00
Serv. Manual NO BID Serv. Manual NO BID Serv. Manual $0.00 Serv. Manual $0.00 Serv. Manual $0.00 Serv. Manual $0.00
BID PRICE | $17,700.00 BID PRICE $0.00 BID PRICE $16,880.00 BID PRICE $18,159.00 BID PRICE $18,547.00 BID PRICE $0.00

Chevrolet Impala LS

Chevrolet Impala LS

Chevrolet Impala LS

Chevrolet Impala LS

Chevrolet Impala LS

Chevrolet Impala LS

Page 21 Page 21 Page 21 Page 21 Page 21 Page 21
BERGLUND TOYOTA CAPITAL GMC TRUCK RK CHEVROLET BILLY CRAFT CHRYSLER Dominion of Bedford Fairfax Hyundai Inc
2014 Chev 1Gx69 LS 2014 Chev 1Gx69 LS
$0.00 $23,262.00 $23,440.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Serv. Manual NO BID Serv. Manual $200.00 Serv. Manual $0.00 Serv. Manual NO BID Serv. Manual NO BID Serv. Manual $0.00
BID PRICE $0.00 BID PRICE $23,462.00 BID PRICE $23,440.00 BID PRICE $0.00 BID PRICE $0.00 BID PRICE $0.00
1/2 Ton Extended 1/2 Ton Extended 1/2 Ton Extended 1/2 Ton Extended Cab]1/2 Ton Extended Cab 1/2 Ton Extended

Cab 4-WD Pickup Cab 4-WD Pickup Cab 4-WD Pickup 4-WD Pickup 4-WD Pickup Cab 4-WD Pickup
Page 22 Page 22 Page 22 Page 22 Page 22 Page 22
Police/Animal Police/Animal Police/Animal Police/Animal Police/Animal Police/Animal
EMIS 2815 EMIS 2815 EMIS 2815 EMIS 2815 EMIS 2815 EMIS 2815
BERGLUND TOYOTA CAPITAL GMC TRUCK RK CHEVROLET BILLY CRAFT CHRYSLER Dominion of Bedford Fairfax Hyundai Inc
2014 Chevy Silverado 2014 Chevy Silverado 2014 Ram/Tradesman/1500

$0.00 $27,630.00 $25,880.00 $0.00 $23,414.00 $0.00
Serv. Manual NOBID |Serv. Manual $350.00 Serv. Manual $0.00 Serv. Manual NO BID Serv. Manual $0.00 Serv. Manual $0.00
BID PRICE $0.00 BID PRICE $27,980.00 BID PRICE $25,880.00 BID PRICE $0.00 BID PRICE $23,414.00 BID PRICE $0.00




1/2 Ton Pickup

1/2 Ton Pickup

1/2 Ton Pickup

1/2 Ton Pickup

1/2 Ton Pickup

1/2 Ton Pickup

Page 23

Page 23

Page 23

Page 23

Page 23

Page 23

Building Maintenance

Building Maintenance

Building Maintenance

Building Maintenance

Building Maintenance

Building Maintenance

Emis 2378/2506

Emis 2378/2506

Emis 2378/2506

Emis 2378/2506

Emis 2378/2506

Emis 2378/2506

BERGLUND TOYOTA CAPITAL GMC TRUCK RK CHEVROLET BILLY CRAFT CHRYSLER Dominion of Bedford Fairfax Hyundai Inc
2014 Toyota, Tundra SR 2014 Chevy Silverado 2014 Chevy Silverado 2014 Ram, 1500 DS1L62 2014 Ram/Tradesman/1500
$26,197.00 $24,144.00 $22,990.00 $22,791.00 $22,455.00 $0.00
Serv. Manual NO BID Serv. Manual $350.00 Serv. Manual $0.00 Serv. Manual $0.00 Serv. Manual $0.00 Serv. Manual $0.00
BID PRICE | $26,197.00 BID PRICE $24,494.00 BID PRICE $22,990.00 BID PRICE $22,791.00 BID PRICE $22,455.00 BID PRICE $0.00
1/2 Ton Pickup 1/2 Ton Pickup 1/2 Ton Pickup 1/2 Ton Pickup 1/2 Ton Pickup 1/2 Ton Pickup
Page 24 Page 24 Page 24 Page 24 Page 24 Page 24
Water Resources Water Resources Water Resources Water Resources Water Resources Water Resources
Emis 2768 Emis 2768 Emis 2768 Emis 2768 Emis 2768 Emis 2768
BERGLUND TOYOTA CAPITAL GMC TRUCK RK CHEVROLET BILLY CRAFT CHRYSLER Dominion of Bedford Fairfax Hyundai Inc
2014 Chevy Silverado 2014 Chevy Silverado 2014 Ram/Tradesman/1500
$0.00 $28,247.00 $26,780.00 $0.00 $23,641.00 $0.00
Serv. Manual NO BID Serv. Manual $350.00 Serv. Manual $0.00 Serv. Manual $0.00] Serv. Manual $0.00| Serv. Manual $0.00
BID PRICE $0.00 BID PRICE $28,597.00 BID PRICE $26,780.00 BID PRICE $0.00 BID PRICE $23,641.00 BID PRICE $0.00
1/2 Ton Pickup 1/2 Ton Pickup 1/2 Ton Pickup 1/2 Ton Pickup 1/2 Ton Pickup 1/2 Ton Pickup
Page 25 Page 25 Page 25 Page 25 Page 25 Page 25
Water Resources/Safety Water Resources/Safety Water Resources/Safety Water Resources/Safety Water Resources/Safety Water Resources/Safety
Emis 2813 Emis 2813 Emis 2813 Emis 2813 Emis 2813 Emis 2813
BERGLUND TOYOTA CAPITAL GMC TRUCK RK CHEVROLET BILLY CRAFT CHRYSLER Dominion of Bedford Fairfax Hyundai Inc
2014 Chevy Silverado 2014 Chevy Silverado 2014 Ram/Tradesman/1500
$0.00 $27,572.00 $25,880.00 $0.00 $22,992.00 $0.00
Serv. Manual NOBID |Serv. Manual $350.00 Serv. Manual $0.00 Serv. Manual $0.00| Serv. Manual $0.00] Serv. Manual $0.00
BID PRICE $0.00 BID PRICE $27,922.00 BID PRICE $25,880.00 BID PRICE $0.00 BID PRICE $22,992.00 BID PRICE $0.00
1/2 Ton Pickup 1/2 Ton Pickup 1/2 Ton Pickup 1/2 Ton Pickup 1/2 Ton Pickup 1/2 Ton Pickup
Page 26 Page 26 Page 26 Page 26 Page 26 Page 26
Water Resources Water Resources Water Resources Water Resources Water Resources Water Resources
Emis 2479 Emis 2479 Emis 2479 Emis 2479 Emis 2479 Emis 2479
BERGLUND TOYOTA CAPITAL GMC TRUCK RK CHEVROLET BILLY CRAFT CHRYSLER Dominion of Bedford Fairfax Hyundai Inc
2014 Chevy Silverado 2014 Chevy Silverado 2014 Ram/Tradesman/1500
$0.00 $28,847.00 $27,440.00 $0.00 $24,590.00 $0.00
Serv. Manual NOBID |Serv. Manual $350.00 Serv. Manual $0.00 Serv. Manual $0.00| Serv. Manual $0.00] Serv. Manual $0.00
BID PRICE $0.00 BID PRICE $29,197.00 BID PRICE $27,440.00 BID PRICE $0.00 BID PRICE $24,590.00 BID PRICE $0.00
$0.00
3/4 Ton Pickup 3/4 Ton Pickup 3/4 Ton Pickup 3/4 Ton Pickup 3/4 Ton Pickup 3/4 Ton Pickup
Page 27/28 Page 27/28 Page 27/28 Page 27/28 Page 27/28 Page 27/28
Streets Dept Streets Dept Streets Dept Streets Dept Streets Dept Streets Dept
Emis 2955 Emis 2955 Emis 2955 Emis 2955 Emis 2955 Emis 2955
BERGLUND TOYOTA CAPITAL GMC TRUCK RK CHEVROLET BILLY CRAFT CHRYSLER Dominion of Bedford Fairfax Hyundai Inc
2015 Chevy Silverado 2014 Ram/Tradesman/2500
$0.00 $0.00 $32,590.00 $0.00 $30,128.00 $0.00
Serv. Manual NOBID |Serv. Manual NO BID Serv. Manual $0.00 Serv. Manual $0.00| Serv. Manual $0.00] Serv. Manual $0.00
BID PRICE $0.00 BID PRICE $0.00 BID PRICE $32,590.00 BID PRICE $0.00 BID PRICE $30,128.00 BID PRICE $0.00




Western 8' Snowplow Western 8' Snowplow Western 8' Snowplow Western 8' Snowplow Western 8' Snowplow Western 8' Snowplow

Page 28 Page 28 Page 28 Page 28 Page 28 Page 28

Streets Dept Streets Dept Streets Dept Streets Dept Streets Dept Streets Dept

Emis 2955 Emis 2955 Emis 2955 Emis 2955 Emis 2955 Emis 2955

BERGLUND TOYOTA CAPITAL GMC TRUCK RK CHEVROLET BILLY CRAFT CHRYSLER Dominion of Bedford Fairfax Hyundai Inc
Meyers EZ - Mount Plus Liftgate Brand/Thieman
$0.00 $0.00 $8,250.00 $0.00 $6,195.00 $0.00

BID PRICE $0.00 BID PRICE $0.00 BID PRICE $8,250.00 BID PRICE $0.00 BID PRICE $6,195.00 BID PRICE $0.00
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