City of Lynchburg
Procurement Division

900 Church Street
Lynchburg, Virginia 24504

Telephone No.: (434) 455-3970
Fax No.: (434) 845-0711

Addendum for Bid

Petroleum Products — Gasoline, Diesel Fuel, Heating Oil and Propane

Date: November 3, 2016 RE: Addendum No. 1

From: Florence Randolph, Bid No.: 2017-034
Purchasing Technician

NOTE: This addendum must be signed and returned with the original package.

The following items are in response to questions generated in regards to the above solicitation;
please amend the bid/proposal as follows:

Questions received for clarification:

1. Obtain a copy of the bid results from last year?
Answer: See attached.

2. Who is your current vendor?
Answer: Propane — Foster Fuels
Heating oil — Watts Petroleum
Tank-wagon — Watts Petroleum
Transport loads — Foster Fuels, Petroleum Traders & Mansfield

3. How long have they been your vendor?
Answer: 5 years

4. Can we bid on transport deliveries only?
Answer: YES

5. Are vendors required to bid on all products?
Answer: NO

6. Are vendors required to bid on tank-wagon deliveries?
Answer: NO

7. Will the bid be awarded to more than one vendor?
Answer: Transport, YES

8. Bid Prices — Is it based on Terminal rack price or OPIS Roanoke/Montvale, VA on 12/1/16?
Answer: Pricing on 12/1/2016 is to minimalize fluctuation in pricing and ensure all bidders are
pricing based on the same day. Load pricing for Transport is rack price; load pricing for Tank-
wagon is OPIS price. Constant pricing shall include all freight, profit, administrative costs, Virginia
Petroleum Storage Tank Fee and the Federal Oil Spill Liability Fee.

Addendum No.1 - Petroleum Products — Bid #: 2017-034 1



10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

15.

Will the City accept transport pricing based on the unbranded OPIS daily average for the
Roanoke/Montvale terminal?
Answer: No, it is based on the rack prices only.

Winter Additive — Pricing for winter additive should be listed as a separate item on the bid?
Answer: There is a line item on the bid pricing sheet for the winter additive price. Bid price should
not include winter additive costs, however, quotes submitted during winter months will include the
winter additive.

Are cold flow winter additives to be delivered with the diesel in the winter months?
Answer: YES

Can the winter additive be added at the time of delivery?
Answer: Underground tanks, No
Aboveground tanks, Yes

What is the contract start date?
Answer: Contract year runs from January 1%"™"9" December 31%. Initial contract term is for two
years with possible renewals.

Can you provide us with a recent invoice for each product from the current contractor?
Answer: See attached.

Just to confirm: when the city wants transport loads they will solicit pricing from all contracted vendors?
Answer: Yes.

READ TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND SIGN

In compliance with the above Invitation for Bid, and subject to all the conditions hereof, the undersigned
offers and agrees to comply with any or all of the terms and conditions contained herein, or as mutually
agreed upon by subsequent negotiations. This form shall become part of the final file.

Company Name:

Address:

Date:

Authorized Signature:

Title:

Print Name:

Telephone #: Fax #:

Addendum No.1 - Petroleum Products — Bid #: 2017-034 2



CITY OF LYNCHBURG

BID TABULATION FORM' _
Petroleum Products - Gasoline, Diesel Fuel, Bio-Diesel,
Heating Oil and Propane
IFB #12-734
BID OPEINING DATE: 12/13/2011 @2:00 P.M.

VENDOR: RKA Petroleum Companies

VENDOR: Mansfield Oil Company

BID PRICES-TRANSPORT LOADS

BID PRICES-TRANSPORT LOADS

Extended

Fuel Type Gallons | Constant | Extended Fuel Type Gallons | Constant
Price Price . Price Price
Gasoline 396,000 0.0517 $20,473.20 Gasoline 396,000 0.0098 [$3,880.80
ULS diesel 334,000 0.0540 ($18,036.00 ULS diesel 334,000 0.0250 |$8,350.00-
B5 bio-diesel 165,000 0.0581 |$9,586.50 B5 bio-diesel 165,000 0.0413 |$6,814.50
TOTAL $48,095.70 TOTAL ) $19,045.30
VENDOR: RKA Petroleum Companies VENDOR: Mansfield Oil Company
OPTION PRICES - TANSPORT LOADS OPTION PRICES - TANSPORT LOADS
Fuel Type Gallons | Constant |  Extended Fuel Type Gallons | Constant | Extended
Price Price Price Price
B10 bio-diesel  [155,000 0.0662 ($10,261.00 B10 bio-diesel 165,000 NO BID |[NOBID
B20 bio-diesel [155,000 0.0697 |$10,803.50 B20 bio-diesel 155,000 NOBID [NOBID
TOTAL $21,064.50 TOTAL $0.00
VENDOR: RKA Petroleum Companies VENDOR: Mansfield Oil Company
BID PRICES-TANKWAGON AND PROPANE BID PRICES-TANKWAGON AND PROPANE
Fuel Type Gallons | Constant | Extended Fuel Type Gallons | Constant Extended
Price Price Price Price
Gasoline 21,000 0.1999 [$4,197.90 Gasoline 21,000 0.3439 |$7,221.90
ULS diesel 14,000 0.1999 [$2,798.60 ULS diesel 14,000 0.3439 |$4,814.60
#2 heating oil 5,000 0.2796 |$1,398.00 #2 heating oll 5,000 0.3439 |[$1,719.50
B5 bio-diesel 14,000 0.2100 |$2,940.00 B5 bio-diesel 14,000 0.3439 |$4,814.60
Propane Minimum' | NO BID |[NO BID Propane Minimum | NOBID [NOBID
TOTAL $11,334.50 TOTAL $18,570.60
VENDOR: RKA Petroleum Companies VENDOR: Mansfield Oil Company
LYNCHBURG TRANSIT AUTHORITY LYNCHBURG TRANSIT AUTHORITY
Fuel Type Gallons | Constant | Extended Fuel Type Gallons | Constant Extended
Price Price Price Price
B5 bio-diesel 306,000 0.0581 ($17,778.60 B5 bio-diesel 306,000 0.0413 |[$12,637.80
TOTAL $17,778.60 TOTAL $12,637.80
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CITY OF LYNCHBURG

BID TABULATION FORM
Petroleum Products - Gasoline, Diesel Fuel, Bio-Diesel,
Heating Oil and Propane

IFB # 12-734

BID OPEINING DATE: 12/13/2011 @

2:00 P.M.

VENDOR: Foster Fuels Inc

BID PRICES-TRANSPORT LOADS

VENDOR: P.M. TERMINALS ING - Lynchburg Oil
BID PRICES-TRANSPORT LOADS.

Fuel Type " Gallons | Constant | Extended Fuel Type - Gallons | Constant |- Extended
' ' Price . Price Price . Price
Gasoline = . 396,000 0.0230 |$9,108.00 Gasoline 396,000 '0.0485 [$19,206.00
ULS diesel 334,000 0.0265 |[$8,851.00 ULS diesel - 334,000 0.0520 |$17,368.00
B5 bio-diesel 165,000 0.0395 |$6,517.50 B5 bio-diesel 165,000 0.0520 |$8,580.00
TOTAL $24,476.50 TOTAL $45,154.00

VENDOR: Foster Fuels Inc

VENDOR: P.M. TERMINALS

INC - Lynchburg Oil-

OPTION PRICES - TANSPORT LOADS = .

OPTION PRICES - TANSPORT LOADS

. Fuel Type Gallons | Constant | Extended Fuel Type Gallons | Constant Extended
‘ Price Price Price Price
B10 bio-diesel 155,000 0.0395 |$6,122.50 B10 bio-diesel 155,000 NO BID |NOBID
B20 bio-diesel |155,000 0.0395 [$6,122.50 B20 bio-diesel 155,000 NOBID |NOBID
TOTAL $12,245.00 TOTAL $0.00

VENDOR: Foster Fuels Inc

VENDOR: P.M. TERMINALS

INC - Lynchburg Oil

BID PRICES-TANKWAGON AND PROPANE

BID PRICES-TANKWAGON AND PROPANE

Fuel Type Gallons | Constant | Extended Fuel Type Gallons | Constant Extended
Price Price ' Price Price
Gasoline’ 21,000 0.2500 |%$5,250.00 Gasoline 21,000 0.1250 |%$2,625.00
ULS diesel 14,000 0.2500 |$3,500.00 ULS diesel 14,000 0.1450 |$2,030.00
#2 heating oil 5,000 0.2500 |$1,250.00 #2 heating oil 5,000 0.1450 |$725.00
B5 bio-diesel 14,000 0.3000 [$4,200.00 B5 bio-diesel 14,000 0.2500 |$3,500.00
Propane Minimum | 0.2500 Propane Minimum | NOBID |NOBID
TOTAL $14,200.00 TOTAL $8,880.00
VENDOR: Foster Fuels Inc. VENDOR: P.M. TERMINALS INC - Lynchburg Oil
LYNCHBURG TRANSIT AUTHORITY LYNCHBURG TRANSIT AUTHORITY -
Fuel Type Gallons | Constant | Extended Fuel Type Gallons | Constant Extended
Price Price Price Price -
B5 bio-diesel 306,000 0.0385 |[$12,087.00 B5 bio-diesel 306,000 0.0520 [$15,912.00
TOTAL $12,087.00 TOTAL $15,912.00
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CITY OF LYNCHBURG
‘BID TABULATION FORM
‘ Petroleum Products - Gasolme, Diesel Fuel, Blo-Dlesel
Heating Oil and Propane .

IFB # 12-734.
BID OPElNlNG DATE 12[13/2011 @2 00 P M.

VENDOR: Petroleum Traders Corporation

VENDOR: PAPCO_INC :

- BID PRICES-TRANSPORT LOADS .

.BID PRICES-TRANSPORT LOADS

Fuel Type Gallons | Constant |  Extended ~ Fuel Type Gallons. | Constant | . Extended
“Price - |  Price R i - Price Price

Gasoline : 396,000. 0.0074 |$2,930.40 Gasoline - - 396,000 0.0549 |$21,740.40

ULS diesel 334,000 | 0.0140 |$4,676.00 ULS diesel . 334,000 0.0596  |$19,906.40

B5 bio-diesel 165,000 | 0.1890 |[$31,185.00 B5 bio-diesel 165,000 0.0896 [$14.784.00

- TOTAL $38,791.40 - TOTAL $56,430.80

VENDOR: Petroleum Traders Corporation

VENDOR: PAPCO INC -

"~ OPTION PRICES - TANSPORT LOADS

OPTION PRICES - TANSPORT LOADS
“Fuel Type Gallons | Constant |© Extended Fuel Type . Gallons | Constant Extended
' Price Price -  Price Price
B10 bio-diesel  |155,000 0.2290 |$35,495.00 B10 bio-diesel 165,000 NOBID |NOBID
B20 bio-diesel  |155,000 0.3190 |$49,445.00 B20 bio-diesel 155,000 NOBID |NOBID
TOTAL $84,940.00 TOTAL $0.00 -

VENDOR: Petroleum Traders Corporation

VENDOR: PAPCO INC

BID PRICES-TANKWAGON AND PROPANE

BID PRICES-TANKWAGON AND PROPANE

Fuel Type Gallons | Constant | Extended - Fuel Type Gallons | Constant Extended
Price Price Price Price
Gasoline 21,000 '0.1500 |$3,150.00 Gasoline - 21,000 NOBID |NOBID
ULS diesel 14,000 0.1500 ($2,100.00 ULS diesel 14,000 NOBID |NOBID
#2 heating oil 5,000 0.1500 |$750.00 #2 heating oil 5,000 NOBID |NOBID
B5 bio-diesel 14,000 0.3000 |%$4,200.00 B5 bio-diesel - 14,000 NOBID |NOBID
Propane Minimum | NO BID |NO BID Propane - - Minimum | NOBID |NOBID
TOTAL $10,200.00 TOTAL $0.00
VENDOR: Petroleum Traders Corporation VENDOR: PAPCO INC
LYNCHBURG TRANSIT AUTHORITY LYNCHBURG TRANSIT AUTHORITY
Fuel Type Gallons | Constant | Extended Fuel Type Gallons. | Constant Extended
Price - Price Price Price .
B5 bio-diesel 306,000 0.0395 [$12,087.00 B5 bio-diesel 306,000 0.0896 |$27.417.60
TOTAL $12,087.00 TOTAL $27,417.60

Page #3
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INVOICE 1

INVOICE NUMBER: 0724630-IN
INVOICE DATE: 10/14/2016
CUSTOMER NO. LYNCCIT
Foster Fuels, Inc. .
P.0. Box 190 SHIP 7O :
16720 Brookneal Hwy FLEET SERVICES
Brookneal, VA 24528 Lynchburg, VA 24501
{434) 376-2322
SOLD TO .
THE CITY OF LYNCHBURG VIRGINIA
1650 MEMORIAL AVENUE
Lynchburg, VA 24501 DUE DATE 10/24r2016
AMOUNT DUE: $12,102 64
AMOUNT REMITTED / 1’ 10 2.6
Email Address:
inchude for prumolional
materal
CUSTOMERF O, TERMS
FLEET SERVICES NET 10 DAYS
ITEM NO. UNIT ORDERED SHIPPED PRICE AMOUNT
T05 GAL 7.480.00 7.480.00 0.00 1.6101 12,043.55
ULTRA LSD/ FLEET SERVICES Whse: 000
VA Petroleum Storage Tank Fee 0.0060 44.88
Virginia Diese! Tax 0.2020 0.00
Federal Diese! Tax 0.2440 G.00
Federal QilSpill Liabifity Fee 0.0019 14.21

BL#464172/ ULTRA LSD/ B-55 1/4 A-83 1/2

Net Invoice: 12,102.64
THANK YOU FOR YQUR BUSINESS! 2% FIN. CHARGE Sales Tax: 3.00
WILL BE ADDED MONTHLY TO PAST DUE BALANCES, Involce Total: _—12.ﬁ§

Foster Fuels, Inc.  P.O. Box 190 Brookneal, VA  Phone : 800-344-6457 / 434-376-2322  Fax : 434-376-5969  www.fosterluels.com



BILL OF LADING #:464172
TRANSACTION # 58376 MAGELLAN MINA DINGS, L.P.  sTarT TIME: 2016-10-14 11:02:10
CPAGE 41 A%ﬂ%%%ﬁsgm%tgw ’8."2'51\%0,“ % 2156 END TIME: 2016-10-14 11:13:33
DOT FIRST RESPONDER INFORMATION GROSS VOL | MEAS
NA1993, DIESEL FUEL, 3, PG lll ERG#128 7500| GAL

ONE CARGG TANK Tk
EMERGENCY CONTACT NUMBER: 800-451-8346 _3E for Magellan ) MAQELLAN

[
TERMINAL ADDRESS: 11851 Lynchburg-Salem Turnipike CARRIER:
Montvale, VA 24122 FOSTER FUELS

BROOKNEAL, VA

: INSURANCE EXP DATE:2017-06-01 23:59:68.0
EPA-Facility 1D:3247-51488 VTC: 121

SUPPLIER: 0844 DESTINATION: 000057
GUTTMAN OiL FOSTER FUELS INC
200 SPEERS ST.
BELLE VERNON, PA VARIOUS, VA

EPA: 0
PETROEX: 101265

GRADE RECIPE INFORMATION GRS NET ADQ |BLN|UOM| GRV |TMP/PSI| MTR | OCT

X ULTRA LOW SULFUR #2 DIESEL 3000 29951 0 N |GAL | 37100 638| 2-1 0.0
UNDYED 15 PPM SULFUR (MAX) ULSD FOR USE IN ALL DIESEL VEHICLES AND ENGINES.
MAY CONTAIN UP TO 5% RENEWABLE FUELS.
X ULTRA LOW SULFUR 42 DIESEL 1000 097 0 N |GAL | 37.100 66.1| 2-2 0.0
UNDYED 15 PPM SULFUR (MAX) ULSD FOR USE IN ALL DIESEL VEHICLES AND ENGINES.
MAY CONTAIN UP TO 5% RENEWABLE FUELS,
X ULTRA LOW SULFUR #2 DIESEL 1000 986 O N |GAL | 37.100 67.0] 2-2 0.0
UNDYED 15 PPM SULFUR {MAX) ULSD FOR USE IN ALL DIESEL VEHICLES AND ENGINES.
MAY CONTAIN UP TO 5% RENEWABLE FUELS.
X ULTRA LOW SULFUR #2 DIESEL 2500 2482 0 N |GAL| 37100 66.8| 2-3 0.0
UNDYED 15 PPM SULFUR (MAX) ULSD FOR USE IN ALL DIESEL VERHICLES AND ENGINES.
MAY CONTAIN UP TO 5% RENEWABLE FUELS.

F\%%% Service S LyV\L)'\\OL\rg

ss a4 ovsp - q3la’

N O Weede

X = 7500, 7480

THIS PRODUCT DOES NOT MEET THE REQUIREMENTS FOR REFORMULATED GAS AND MAY NOT BE USED (N ANY REFORMULATED
GASOLINE COVERED AREA. CONTACT THE INVENTORY OWNER AND/OR SUPPLIER OF THIS PRODUCT TO DETERMINE IF IT

HAS BEEN RESTRICTED FROM USE IN ANY PRODUCT MARKETED AS E15.

iF PRODUCT IS DESTINED FOR VIRGINIA OR NORTH CAROLINA, THE SUPPLIER IS RESPONSIBLE FOR DESTINATION STATE MOTOR FUEL TAXES AND/OR FEES.
GASOLINE WITH AN "0O" OR “A* SUFFIX IN THE BLN(BLEND) COLUMN IS E10: CONTAINS BETWEEN 9 AND 10 VOL% ETHANOL.
GASOLINE WITH A "S* SUFFIX IN BLN(BLEND) COLUMN iS E7.8 - CONTAINS UP TO 7.8%ETHANOL.

GASOLINE WITH "G" IN BLN(BLEND) COLUMN CONTAINS GREATER THAN 10% ETHANOL.

DO NOT BLEND THESE FUELS WITH ETHANOL OR ANY OTHER OXYGENATE.

GASOLINE WITH “B* OR "N* SUFFIX IN BLN(BLEND) COLUMN IS E0: CONTAINS NO ETHANOL,

MAGELLAN TERMINAL HOLDINGS, L.P.,P.O. BOX 22186

TULSA, QKLAHOMA, 74121-2186 EPA #3427 ENTITY-FACILITY 1D 3247-81488

CARRIER CERTIFIES that the CARGO TANK or TANKS, supplied for tris shipment 15 a proper container for the transponatior of this commodity. By leaving Magellan property with this document, ! acknowledge
thar if | have been injured while on terminal premises, | have notified Magellan Pipefine persannel of this fact prior to ieaving the terminal. [ also acknowledge that | was provided a copy of the appropridte

Emergency Response Guide(s) with this Bill of Lading.
SEALS I | BapcemRIVER: s0798 Neil Morton / ;"P'; Bodumani: vilo

This volume of neat or blended ethanol, bio diesel or renewable dieset is designated and intended for use as trangponation fuel, heat g ol or jet fual in the 48 U.S. contiguous states and Hawaii. Any persons
exporting this fuel is subject to the requirermnents of 40 CFR 80, 1430.




THE CITY OF LYNCHBURG

/\’?' FLEET SERVICES

City of Lynchburg — Fleet Services

REQUEST FOR FUEL QUOTATION
Date of Request: 10/13/16
PHONE: (434) 455-4425
CONTACT PERSON: Roberta Wright

PRODUCT REQUIREB ﬁLSD 15 Clear

QUANTITY REQUES'EED ransport load 7,500 gal +/-
DELIVERY DATE REQUIRED: 10/14/16

LOCATION OF DELIVERY: MEMORIAL AVE FUEL SITE

SPECIAL NOTES:

- Price to include delivery charge and any taxes applicable.
Show pricing below.

- Before and after each fuel delivery, tank shall have stick read,
pasted, tested for water and verified.

QUOTE DEADLINE: §:5am —Friday, Oct. 2, 2016(EST)

FAX QUOTATIONS TQ: (434)847-1810

PRICE: §_I,( 380
DELIVERY DATE: _(0//“//C

Company Name: 6)5{'&" Feels Phone: GO0~-34HY -(HS” ?
Contact Person: ﬁﬁ‘&-‘f&—\ J &»—c«f Date: "ID// ‘f// (7

SIGNATURE:




FLEET SERVICES

. i ‘ THE CITY OF LYNCHBURG

City of Lynchburg - Fleet Services

REQUEST FOR FUEL QUOTATION
Date of Request: 10/13/16
PHONE: (434) 455-4425
CONTACT PERSON: Roberta Wright

PRODUCT REQUIRED: ULSD 15 Clear

QUANTITY REQUESTED: Transport load 7,500 gal +/-
DELIVERY DATE REQUIRED: 10/14/16

LOCATION OF DELIVERY: MEMORIAL AVE FUEL SITE
SPECIAL NOTES:

- Price to include delivery charge and any taxes applicable.
Show pricing below.

- Before and after each fuel delivery, tank shall have stick read,
pasted, tested for water and verified.

QUOTE DEADLINE: 8:15am -Friday, Oct. 2, 2016(EST)

FAX QUOTATIONS TO: (434) 847-1810

PRICE: $1.6527_

DELIVERY DATE: 10-14-16

Company Name: Petroleum Traders Phone: 800-348-3705 x 5899

Contact Person: Seth_ Date: 10-14-16

SIGNATURE: Seth Henline



CITY OF LYNCHBURG MANSFIELD OIL COMPANY

1650 MEMORIAL AVENUE 1025 AIRPORT PARKWAY SW
¥k ok RGPOTHHF* K GAINESVILLE, GA 30501
LYNCHBURG, VA 24501 FEIN 58-1091383

PRICES EFFECTIVE 10/14/2016 00:00

City Terminal Product Price Freight Taxes Total
LYNCHBURG MONTVALE, VA 87 UNL W/10%ETH 1.5935 0.0304 0.0087 1.6326
ULSD CLEAR 1.6275 0.0360 0.0089 1.6724
LYNCHBURG ROANOKE, VA ULSD CLEAR 1.6295 0.0376 0.0088% 1.6760
ULSD 5% BIO 1.6625 0.0376 0.0088 1.7089

Prices include preduct, freight and all applicable fees.
For questions concerning this price letter, or to place an order, please call
678-450-2135 and ask for Becki Woodall.

Thank You for the Opportunity!
Rebecca Noblett



INVOICE 1

INVCICE NUMBER: 0725179-IN
INVOICE DATE: 10/27:2016
CUSTOMER NO. : LYNCCIT
Foster Fuels, Inc. .
P.O. Box 190 SHIP 7O :
16720 Brookneal Hwy FLEET SERVICES
Brookneal, VA 24528 Lynchburg, VA 24501
(434) 376-2322
SOLD TO
THE CITY OF LYNCHBURG VIRGINIA
1650 MEMORIAL AVENUE
Lynchburg, VA 24501 DUE DATE:; 11/62018
AMOUNT DUE $11.864 12
AMOUNT REMITTED -
), %4
Email Address;
include for promotionn!
material
CUSTOMER P.C. TERMS
FLEET SERVICES NET 10 DAYS
{TEM NO. UNIT ORDERED SHIPPED PRICE AMOUNT
T13 GAL 8,285.00 8,285.00 0.00 1.4241 11,798.67
E-10 REG UNL Whse: 000
VA Petroleum Storage Tank Fee 0.0060 49.71
Virginia Gasoline Tax 0.1620 0.00
Federal Gasoline Tax 0.1840 0.00
Federal OilSpiil Liability Fee 0.0019 15.74

BL#465337/E-10 REG UNL/B-41 1/2" A-83 1/2"/RW

) Net Invoice: 11,864.12
THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS! 2% FIN. CHARGE Sales Tax: 0.00
WILL BE ADDED MONTHLY TO PAST DUE BALANCES. invoice Total: T 11.864.12

Foster Fuels, inc.  P.O. Box 130 Brookneal, VA  Phone : 800-344-6457 / 434-376-2322  Fax : 434-376-5969  www.fosterfusls.com



BILL OF LADING #:465337 MAGELLAN R D*NGS L P
TRANSACTION #:27386 START TIME: 2016-10-27 10:43:10
PAGE #:1 B BN 22106, TULS L BT AHOM ""Q" 5 END TIME: 2016-10-27 10:57:31
DOT FIRST RESPONDER INFORMAT GROSS VOL | MEAS

UN1203, GASCOLINE. 3. PGl ERG#128 8301) GAL

C”)
>
I
o
£
>
~§-
ﬂ
I
ot

ONE CARGO TANK MA“’GQQL&A N.

EMERGENCY CONTACT NUMBER: 800-451-8346 3E for Magelian
[ ERMINAL ADDRESS. 11851 Lynchburg-Salem Tumpike | {ER:
TERMINAL ADDRESS: 11851 Lynchburg-Salem Turnpike CARR
Montvale, VA 24122 FOSTER FUELS

BROOKNEAL, VA

INSURANCE EXP DATE:2017-08-01 23:59:59.0
EPA-Facility 10:3247-81488 VTC: 121 '

SUPPLIER: 0879 DESTINATION: 000057
MARATHON FOSTER FUELS INC
539 S. MAIN ST,
FINDLAY, CH VARIOUS, VA
EPA:Q

PETROEX: 522143

GRADE RECIPE INFORMATION GRS NET ADD |BLN|UOM| GRV |TMP/PSI| MTR | OCT

NZ UNLEADED REGULAR 998 g97| 5 O [GAL | B3 11g 624 14 87.0
DETERGENT ADDIT!IZED FOR UP TO 10% ETHANOL
GASOLINE WITH AN 0™ IN THE ADD'BLEND COLUMN IS E10:
CONTAINS BETWEEN 8 AND 10% VOL ETHANOL.

NZ UNLEADED REGULAR 1000 898 & G |GAL | 63.004 62.7] 14 87.0
DETERGENT ADDITIZED FOR UP TO 10% ETHANOL
GASOLINE WITH AN “O* IN THE ADD/BLEND COLUMN 18 E10:
CONTAINS BETWEEN 9 AND 10% VOL ETHANOL

NZ UNLEADED REGULAR 2303 2298 5 O |GAL | 63.098 83.5| 1-5 | B7.0
DETERGENT ARDITIZED FOR UP TO 10% ETHANOL
GASOLINE WITH AN "O" IN THE ADDYBLEND COLUMNIS £10:
CONTAINS BETWEEN 9 AND 10% VOL FTHANOL.

NZ UNLEADED REGULAR 1000 g9 & 0O |GAL | 63.109 62.5| 1-6 | 87.0
DETERGENT ADDITIZED FGR UP TO 10% ETHANOL
GASQLINE WITH AN “O™* IN THE ADDVBLEND COLUMN 1S E10:
CONTAINS BETWEEN 9 AND 10% VOL ETHANOL,

NZ UNLEADED REGULAR 3000 2993 5 O |GAL | 83.107 63.5| 1-6 | 87.0
DETERGENT ADDITIZED FOR UP TO 10% ETHANQOL
GASOLINE WiTH AN "0O™ IN THE ADD/BLEND COLUMN 18 E10:
CONTAINS BETWEEN 9 AND 10% VOL ETHANOL.

L )/V\C,]'\buy"j Fle *@‘!””S'erw‘ceg

V2= Ewvv/L - 372
/L/D weste

NZ = 8301, 8285

THIS PRODUCT DOES NQT MEET THE REQUIREMENTS FOR REFORMULATED GAS AND MAY NOT BE USED iN-ANY REFORMULATED
GASOLINE COVERED AREA. CONTACT THE INVENTORY OWNER AND/OR SUPPLIER OF THIS PRODUCT TO DETERMINE IF IT

HAS BEEN RESTRICTED FROM USE IN ANY PRODUCT MARKETED AS E15.

IF PRODUCT IS DESTINED FOR VIRGINIA OR NORTH CAROLINA, THE SUPPLIER IS RESPONSIBLE FOR DESTINATION STATE MOTOR FUEL TAXES AND/OR FEES.
GASOLINE WITH AN "0O" OR "A* SUFFIX IN THE BLN(BLEND) COLUMN IS E10: CONTAINS BETWEEN 9@ AND 10 VOL% ETHANOL.
GASOLINE WITH A "S” SUFFIX IN BLN{BLEND) COLUMN IS E7.8 - CONTAINS UP TO 7 8%ETHANOL.

GASOLINE WITH "G" IN BLN(BLEND) COLUMN CONTAINS GREATER THAN 10% ETHANOL.

DO NOT BLEND THESE FUELS WITH ETHANOL OR ANY OTHER OXYGENATE.

GASOLINE WITH "B" OR "N* SUFFIX IN BLN(BLEND) COLUMN IS EO: CONTAINS NO ETHANOL.

MAGELLAN TERMINAL HOLDINGS, L.P. P.O. BOX 22188

TULSA, OKLAHOMA, 74121-2186 EPA #3427 ENTITY-FACILITY tD 3247-81488

CARRIER CERTIFIES that the CARGO TANK or TANKS, supplied lor thus shipmenl is a proper container for the ransporiation of this commudity. By leaving Magelian property with this document, | acknowledge
that if | have been injured while on terminal premises, | have nofified Magellan Pipeline personnel of this fact prior {0 leaving the terminal, | also acknowledge that | was provided a copy of the appropriate
Emergency Response Guide(s) with this Bill of Lading.

-

I SEALS “ BADGE/DRIVER: 50798 Neil Morton Al Document 1D: vi.0

This voume of neat or blended ethanal, o diesel or renewabie diesel is designated and intended for use as transportation fuel, heating il or jet fuel in the 48 U.S. cantiguous states and Hawail. Any persons
exponting this iuel is subject to the requirements of 40 CFR 80.1430.




THE CITY OF IYNCHBURG
FLE ET SERVICES

City-‘hoﬁf Lynchburg—FleetSewxces
REQUEST FOR FUEL QUOTATION
Date of Request: 10/26/16
PHONE: (434) 455-4425
CONTACT PERSON: Roberta Wright

PRODUCT REQUIRED: §70ctane E-10
QUANTITY REQUESTED: Transport load 8,500 gal +/-
DELIVERY DATE REQUIRED: 10/27/16

LOCATION OF DELIVERY: MEMORIAL AVE FUEL SITE

SPECIAL NOTES: - .

- Price to include delWerwchargeand any taxes applicable
Show pricing below ¥ &7,

- Delivery truck shall have vapor recovery features

- Before and after each fuel delivery, tank shall have stick read,
pasted, tested for water and verified

QUOTE DEADLINE: 8:15 am - Thurs., Oct. 27, 2016(EST)
FAX QUOTATIONS TO: (434) 847-1810

PRICE: $ l "{3;20

BELIVERY mm {Q/Q‘?/ (C
Company Name: /%ss}—:f Fm(ﬁ» . Phone: R0 ZHY (HS T

TR 43 g 1 Tir
Contact Person: 4664%\ (N Date: (0/)'7/{ o

SIGNATURE:




THE CITY OF LYNCHBURG
L' FLEET SERVICES

City of Lynchburg — Fleet Services

REQUEST FOR FUEL QUOTATION
Date of Request: 10/26/16
PHONE.: (434) 455-4425
CONTACT PERSON: Roberta Wright

PRODUCT REQUIRED: 870ctane E-10
QUANTITY REQUESTED: Transport load 8,500 gal +/-
DELIVERY DATE REQUIRED: 10/27/16
LOCATION OF DELIVERY: MEMORIAL AVE FUEL SITE
SPECIAL NOTES:
- Price to include delivery charge and any taxes applicable
Show pricing below
- Delivery truck shall have vapor recovery features
- Before and after each fuel delivery, tank shall have stick read,
pasted, tested for water and verified
QUOTE DEADLINE: 8:15 am — Thurs., Oct. 27, 201 6(EST)
FAX QUOTATIONS TO: (434) 847-1810

PRICE: $1.4403

DELIVERY DATE: 10-27-16

Company Name: Seth Henline Phone: 800-348-3705 x 5899

Contact Person: __Seth__ Date: _10-27-16

SIGNATURE: Seth Henline



*

JITY OF LYNCHBURG MANSFIELD OIL COMPANY

1650 MEMORIAL AVENUE 1025 AIRPORT PARKWAY SW
kX x X QPOTH* ¥ * GAINBSVILLE, GA 30501
LYNCHBURG, VA 24501 FEIN 58-1091383

2RICES EFFECTIVE 10/27/2016 00:00

Jity Terminal Product Price Freight Taxes Total
LJYNCHBURG MONTVALE, VA 87 UNL W/10%ETH 1.4630 0.0304 0.0087 1.5021
ULSD CLEAR 1.6050 0.0360 0.0089 1.6499
LJYNCHBURG ROANOKE, VA ULSD CLEAR 1.6305 0.0376 0.008% 1.6770
ULSD 5% BIO 1.6400 0.0376 0.0088 1.6864

o>rices include product, freight and all applicable fees.
for questions concerning this price letter, or to place an order, please call
578-450-2135 and ask for Becki Woodall.

Thank You for the Opportunity!
rebecca Noblett
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ORIGINAL INVOICE

H ]l\()l } ii\l

WaTtTs PeTroLEUM CoRP.
1505 Rutherford Strest

Lynchburg, Virginia 24501

(434) 846-6509

No. 63721

THIS PRODUCT DOES NOT MEET THE_REQUIREMENTS DRIVER TRUCK NO. CUST. ORD. NO. DATE
FOR REFORMULATED GASOLINE AND MAY NOT BE USED
IN A REFORMULATED GASOLINE AREA. Q / 5
PACKAGES GALLONS TAX TOTAL
NO. wno | M PRODUCT POUNDS PRICE  "Zep. [sTaTe | LOCAL | PRICE -
PLUS UNLEADED MINIMUM OCTANE 88 (Ra&M) 2
GASOLINE FLAMMABLE LIQUID UN1203 b
REGULAR UNLEADED MINIMUM OCTANE 87 (R&M) 2 ? : /- )
(@soune ) FLAMMABLE LIGUID u(mzaa 300 : / v V?X‘S . .0% (Y78 17‘(7{61' b (1(
PREMIUM UNLEADED MINIMUM OCTANE 92 (R&M) 2 i L
GASOLINE FLAMMABLE LIQUID UN1203
ci'/jui Uedbd Y
PAYMENT A EREON T
A JTHE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO PAY FOR THE GQODS UISTED HEREO iig ? 3’
THE STATE TAX OR TAKES IMPOSED HEREON HAS BEEN RECD BY ' M <T e, W ? ( ?
ASSUMED AND WILL BE PAID BY VENDOR ON OR BEFORE FIAM NAME: 252 L
DUE DATE AS REQUIRED BY LAW. PER e SUB JECT TO
PLEASE RETURN ONE GOPY OF INVOICE WITH YOUR CHECK. CLERICAL & EARGRS

,MOLa;no-o4++~5§ﬁo-ou(5

Voen\dn

10037
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INVOICE 1
55 (p00. O OOS/ INVOICE NUMBER 310285T-N
INVOICE DATE: 811512016
CUSTOMER NO. : LYNCFIR
Foster Fuels, Inc .
P.0. Box 190 SHIP TO:
16720 Brookneal Hywy CITY OF LYNCHBURG FIRE DEPT
Brookneal, VA24528 800 MADISON STREET

(434) 376-2322 Lynchburg, VA 24504
SOLD TO :
CITY OF LYNCHBURG
800 MADISON STREET
Lynchburg, VA 24504
Emai! Address
Include for promotional
material
CUSTOMER P.O. TERMS
NET 30 DAYS
ITEM NO. UNIT ORDERED SHIPPED PRICE AMOUNT
15 GAL 37.40 37.40 0.00 0.8790 32.87
LP GAS/M20 GAL TANK Whse: 000
Federal Propane PERC Fee 0.0050 0.19

Net Invoice 33.06
Sales Tax 0.00
Invoice Total: 33.06

Foster Fuels, Inc, P.O.Box 190 Brookneal, VA  Phone : 800-344-6457 / 434-376-2322 Fax: 434-376-5969  www.fosterfuels.com



VIFIGINAL INVOUILE

Date ..ot A N 200 %0

METER READING - BEFORE AND AFTER DELIVERY

4

WATTS

WarTs PeTrROLEUM CORP.
1505 Rutherford Street

PETROLEUM Lynchburg. Virgima 24501
FUEL OIL~ PROPANE + GASOLINE (434) 846-6509
SOLD 70: 5 Wt "y 7]
—_—— e ———— ;'_ S, Sy it — =k e
GALLONS -
ey iﬁooucr DELIVERED I FPEE(.};E_ L ?’D'x:\‘L AMOEJET
HEATING OHL - P02 NA 1993 | ; T
FLAMMASLE LIQUID A" i j__H__ [ 3
BDIESEL ULSD - P03 MA 1983 T
FLAMMABLECQUD | 1 ]
KEROSENE - DYED - P01 UN 1223] !
FLAMMABLE LIQUID . = s
KEROSENE - CLEAR - POT UN4223 I i
FLAMMABLE LIQUID ;
ILE Lial rh _ et ol .
(0C( 2400 ©E«s 515500 jog/ 3 |
-1 ; ' -
- micde (% R S
TOTAL, ) \| | 1
DELIVERY RECEIVED v
PER
{FIRM NAME)

Received Payment

TERMS NET - 10th OF FOLLOWING MONTH

Subject to Correction of Clencal Errors





