CITY OF LYNCHBURG, VIRGINIA

BID TABULATION FORM

CITY PROJECT NO. IFB #15-939 Page1 |PROJECT NAME: Mini Van - 7 -Passengers
BID OPENING DATE: October 23,2014 @ 2:00 P.M. UNSEALED BID Sparc House
BUYER| Florence Randolph SEALED BID X
TABULATOR Florence Randolph
Berglund
Dominion of OakRidge R K Lynchburg Highview Zenith Sales
VENDOR/CONTRACTOR Bedford Toyota Chevrolet Nissan Motors Indiana LLC
2015 Dodge 2014
Grand Caravan Toyota 2015 Toyota | 2014 Nissan
SE Sienna Sienna Quest
Model Model L Model # Model #
RTKH53 (5328) (5328) 55114
VA Contractor's License No.
TERMS/DELIVERY 10 Weeks 1 Week | 12-17 Weeks 1 Week
ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT YES NO YES NO
ITEM UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
# DESCRIPTION QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1|Mini Van - 7 Passenger - Sparc House 1 $21,896.00| $26,590.00{  $26,755.00{ $23,651.00 $0.00 $0.00
2|Service Manual 1 NONE Website 180.00 | Standard
TOTAL PROJECT $21,896.00| $26,590.00| $26,935.00 $23,651.00 No Bid No Bid
COMMENTS
AWARD TO: Dominion of Bedford AWARD

LOWEST BIDDER? YES ***IF NO, JUSTIFICATION IS

PREPARED BY: Florence Randolph Date: 10/23/2014

APPROVED BY: Florence Randolph Date: 11/03/201

Magic City Ford - No Bid
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CITY OF LYNCHBURG, VIRGINIA

BID TABULATION FORM

CITY PROJECT NO. IFB # 15939 Page1 |PROJECT NAME:
BID OPENING DATE: October 23,2014 @ 2:00 P.M. UNSEALED BID Van - 12-Passengers - Juvenile Detention Center
BUYER| Florence Randolph SEALED BID X
TABULATOR Florence Randolph
Berglund
Dominion of OakRidge RK Lynchburg Highview Zenith Sales
VENDOR/CONTRACTOR Bedford Toyota Chevrolet Nissan Motors Indiana LLC
2015
Chevrolet |2014 Nissan| 2015 GMC | 2015 Zenith
Express NV 2500 Savana Motors
Model # Model # Model # Shuttle Van
C623406 61614 TG23406 Electric
VA Contractor's License No.
TERMS/DELIVERY 12-17 Weeks 1 Week 6-7 Weeks 4 Weeks
ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT YES NO YES NO YES NO
ITEM UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
# DESCRIPTION QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1|Van - 12 Passenger - Juvenile Detention Center 1 $0.00 $0.00| $25,528.00| $26,159.00 $25,061.00] $102,399.00
2|Service Manual 1 180.00 278.77
TOTAL PROJECT No Bid No Bid | $25,708.00 | $26,159.00| $25,339.77 | $102,399.00
COMMENTS
AwArD To: Highview Motors AWARD

LOWEST BIDDER? YES ***IF NO, JUSTIFICATION IS

PREPARED BY: Florence Randolph Date: 10/23/2014

APPROVED BY: Florence Randolph Date: 11/03/2014

Magic City Ford - No Bid
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CITY OF LYNCHBURG, VIRGINIA

BID TABULATION FORM

CITY PROJECT NO. IFB # 15-939 Page 1 |PROJECT NAME:
BID OPENING DATE: October 23,2014 @ 2:00 P.M. UNSEALED BID Van - 12 -Passengers - Opportunity House
BUYER| Florence Randolph SEALED BID X ]
TABULATOR Florence Randolph
Berglund
Dominion of OakRidge R K Lynchburg Highview Zenith Sales
VENDOR/CONTRACTOR Bedford Toyota Chevrolet Nissan Motors Indiana LLC
2015
Chevrolet |[2014 Nissan| 2015 GMC [ 2015 Zenith
Express NV 2500 Savana Motors
Model # Model # Model # Electric
C623406 61614 TG23406 Cargo Van
VA Contractor's License No.
TERMS/DELIVERY 12-17 Weeks 1 Week 6 - 8 Weeks
ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT YES NO YES NO YES
ITEM UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
# DESCRIPTION QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1| Van - 12-Passenger - Opportunity House 1 $0.00 $0.00 $25,257.00] $26,159.00 $24,861.00| $102,399.00
2|Service Manual 1 180.00 278.77
TOTAL PROJECT No Bid No Bid | $25,437.00 | $26,159.00] $25,139.77 | $102,399.00
COMMENTS
AwARrD T0: Highview Motors AWARD

LOWEST BIDDER? YES ***IF NO, JUSTIFICATION IS

PREPARED BY: Florence Randolph Date: 10/23/2014

APPROVED BY: Florence Randolph Date: 11/03/2014

Magic City Ford - No Bid
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CITY OF LYNCHBURG, VIRGINIA

BID TABULATION FORM

CITY PROJECT NO. IFB # 15-939 Page 1 |PROJECT NAME: | Cargo Van -3/4 Ton - AWD WasteWater Treatment Plant -
BID OPENING DATE: October 23,2014 @ 2:00 P.M. UNSEALEDBID |Dept of Water Resources
BUYER| Florence Randolph SEALED BID X
TABULATOR Florence Randolph
Berglund
Dominion of OakRidge R K Lynchburg Highview Zenith Sales
VENDOR/CONTRACTOR Bedford Toyota Chevrolet Nissan Motors Indiana LLC
2015 2014 Nissan 2015 Zenith
Chevrolet NV Cargo Motors/
Express 2500 Electric
Cargo
Model # Model # Van/Model
C623405 62314 250
VA Contractor's License No.
TERMS/DELIVERY 12-17 Weeks 1 Week 4 Weeks
ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT YES NO YES NO NO
ITEM UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
# DESCRIPTION QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1|Cargo Van - 3/4 Ton - AWD 1 $0.00 $0.00 $22,673.00f $27,806.00 $0.00 $97,370.00
2|Service Manual 1 180.00
TOTAL PROJECT No Bid No Bid | $22,853.00 | $27,806.00 No Bid $97,370.00
COMMENTS
AWARD TO: NO AWARD

'LOWEST BIDDER? NO ***IF NO, JU
PREPARED BY: Florence Randolph
APPROVED BY: Florence Randolph

STIFICATION IS:

NO AWARD FOR THIS LINE ITEM

Date: 10/28/2014
Date: 11/03/2014

[Magic City Ford - No Bid
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