
        CITY OF LYNCHBURG VIRGINIA
                    BID TABULATION FORM

CITY PROJECT NO.  IFB # 14-900 Page 1 PROJECT NAME                      
BID OPENING DATE:  March 25, 2014  at 3:00 p.m. UNSEALED BID
BUYER   Florence Randolph SEALED BID X
TABULATOR    Florence Randolph

VENDOR/CONTRACTOR
Capital GMC 
Trucks, Inc.

Dominion of 
Bedford Inc.

Hall 
Automotive

RK 
Chevrolet 

2014 Ram 
Model C/V 
Tradesman 
(RTKE53)

2014 Ford, 
Transit 

Connect (S6E)
               VA Contractor's License No.

TERMS/DELIVERY 8-10 wks 

17-21 wks  Est. 
120-150 days 

ARO 
ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT YES YES

ITEM UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT

# DESCRIPTION QTY. PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL

1 Ford Transit Connect XL - Cargo Vans 4 $0.00 $0.00 $20,340.00 $81,360.00 $20,680.00 $82,720.00 $0.00 0.00
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Service Manual 1 $150.00 $150.00

AWARD
TOTAL PROJECT $0.00 $81,360.00 $82,870.00 0.00

COMMENTS
AWARD TO:  HALLS AUTOMOTIVE
LOWEST BIDDER?  NO   ***IF NO, JUSTIFICATION IS: Customer specify Ford F150 in their bid
PREPARED BY:  Florence Randolph                      Date: 3/25/2014

APPROVED BY: Florence Randolph                      Date: 3/25/2014

 

ON LINE SUBSCRIPTION 

LIGHT DUTY VEHICLES - SCHOOLS TRANSPORTATION
FORD TRANSIT CONNECT XL - CARGO  VANS 



         CITY OF LYNCHBURG VIRGINIA
           BID TABULATION FORM

CITY PROJECT NO.  IFB # 14-900 Page 2 PROJECT NAME                      
BID OPENING DATE: March 25, 2014 at 3:00 p.m. UNSEALED BID
BUYE   Florence Randolph SEALED BID X
TABULATOR    Florence Randolph
VENDOR/CONTRACTOR

Capital GMC 
Trucks, Inc.

Dominion 
of Bedford 

Inc.
Hall Automotive RK Chevrolet 

               VA Contractor's License No. 2014 GMC Savana

2014 Chevro 
Express 

2500/CG23405 

2014 Chevro 
Express 

2500/CG23405 
TERMS/DELIVERY End of June/July 8 to 13 wks 10 to 18 wks
ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT YES YES YES
ITEM UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT

# DESCRIPTION QTY. PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL

1
Chevrolet Savana 2500 RWD 3/4 Ton Cargo 
Van #1 1 $18,604.90 NO AWARD $0.00 NO BID $22,816.00 NO AWARD $21,455.00 NO AWARD

Mileage 1 $41.40

2
Chevrolet Savana 2500 RWD 3/4 Ton Cargo 
Van #2  - (Rejected bid item #2) 1 Rejected bid item NO AWARD 0.00 Rejected bid item NO AWARD Rejected bid item NO AWARD

3 Service Manual 1 265.00 0.00 $0.00 ONLINE 200.00
TOTAL PROJECT $18,911.30 $0.00 $22,816.00 21,655.00

COMMENTS
AWARD TO:   NO AWARD 
LOWEST BIDDER?  NO     ***IF NO, JUSTIFICATION IS:
PREPARED BY:  Florence Randolph                      Date: 3/25/2014

APPROVED BY: Florence Randolph                      Date: 3/25/2014

LIGHT DUTY VEHICLES - SCHOOLS TRANSPORATATION 
Chevrolet Savana 2500 RWD 3/4 Ton Cargo Vans

Customer will use VA State Contract  - on van #1
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         CITY OF LYNCHBURG VIRGINIA
               BID TABULATION FORM

CITY PROJECT NO.  IFB # 14-900 Page 3 PROJECT NAME                      
BID OPENING DATE: March 25, 2014 at 3:00 p.m. UNSEALED BID
BUYER   Florence Randolph SEALED BID X
TABULATOR    Florence Randolph

VENDOR/CONTRACTOR

Capital GMC 
Trucks

Dominion of 
Bedford 

Hall 
Automotive RK Chevrolet 

2014            
Ram 1500 

Tradesman/
Express

2014 Ford 
F150 (X1C)

2014 Chevy 
1500 

Silverado 
               VA Contractor's License No.
TERMS/DELIVERY 10 wks 8 to 13 wks 8 TO 12 wks
ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT YES YES YES

ITEM UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
# DESCRIPTION QTY. PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL

1

1/2 Ton Pickup, 
Extended Cab, 
Short Bed 4"x2" 1 NO BID NO BID $20,107.00 $22,545.00 $23,357.00

Service Manual 1 ONLINE 270.00 200.00             
$22,545.00 23,357.00

TOTAL PROJECT $0.00 $20,107.00 $22,815.00 23,557.00

COMMENTS
AWARD TO:  NO AWARD - ON THIS ITEM Customer will use VA-State Contract 

LOWEST BIDDER?  NO     ***IF NO, JUSTIFICATION IS:
PREPARED BY:  Florence Randolph                      Date: 3/25/2013

APPROVED BY: Florence Randolph                      Date: 3/25/2014

LIGHT DUTY VEHICLES - SCHOOLS TRANSPORATATION                            
1/2 Ton Pickup, Extended Cab, Short Bed, 4"x2"  
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